SOUTHERN NEVADA
AMENDMENTS

TO THE

2018 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING
CODE

AS AMENDED BY THE CITY OF
NORTH LAS VEGAS

CiTY OF
NORTH LAS VEGAS

Page 1 of 92



PREFACE

This document was developed by the Southern Nevada Building Officials’ International
Building Code — General committee and presents recommended amendments to the 2018
International Building Code as published by the International Code Council

Participation in the 2018 IBC Committee was open to all interested parties. However, voting
on amendment proposals was limited to one vote each for six of Southern Nevada
municipalities (Clark County, Henderson, Las Vegas, North Las Vegas, Boulder City, and
Mesquite), the Clark County School District, and three industry representatives, All
committee proceedings were conducted in accordance with Robert’s Rules of Order.

The recommended amendments contained herein are not code unless adopted and codified
by governmental jurisdictions. These amendments are not intended to prevent the use of
any material or method of construction not specifically prescribed herein, provided any
alternates have been approved and their use authorized by the Building Official. This
document may be copied and used in whole or in part without permission or approval from
the organizations listed on the cover page.

Page 2 of 92



TABLE OF CONTENTS

Chapter 1Scope and AdMInStration..............ccoceiiveiiiiiee e seeeervecsreee e s e e eeeeaeas 8
Section 202 DefinIIONS ...........coo it sen s s sneses s s sessasssrstssssssnme e 8
Section 305.23 Six or Fewer Chilkdren n_a Dwelling Unit .......cococovnieeeeeeeeveeeereesrssssnes 9
Section 3086 Institutional Group 1-4,Day Care Facilities .............ccouevevevieeveecessenennn 9
Section 308.6.1Classification as GroUP 3.......ccoiiviiiicie e ererieerseseee e s seaeseeaeas 10
Section 308.6.3 Six or Fewer Persons ReCeiviNgCare ........oceeeeeeeeeveveeseeseveneans 10
Section 308.6.4 Six or Fewer Persons Receiving Care ina Dwelling Unit.................. 10
Section 310.4 Residential Group R-2.........ccciriiiieieeeieinire e ses e s stsssseesenes 10
Section 3105 Residential GroUP R=3.........ocoiiiirieeeeeeeeeeeessereeeseesseersseaessssressssseesas 10
Section 402.4.1Area and Types of ConstruCtioN .........cceeveeeeeeeeiececveercees e eeeeee e 1"
Section 403. 1APPICADIIILY ......cccevee ettt e ee e e s et ne s e e eeseeaeaa 1"
Section 403.3 Automatic Sprinkler System ..........cccecciviiiiiiei e et 1"
Section403.4.7 SMOKe REMOVAI .....ccovveeeeiiecciectiit e e eee e eseeresseseeesesseeeeeneeens 12
Sections 403.52 Additional EXt STAINWAY ..........ccccvrrireeeeeeeeeeeeereceresneseceeesseseeeeeras 5
Section 403.5.3 Stairway Door Operation.........c..ceeeeeeiieeeriesiiriesee e eeeensesseeeseeeas 15
Section 403.5.4 SMokeproof ENCIOSUIES ...........ovvveeeeiieeeeeeecee st ee e enessaneas 1
Section 403.6.1Fire Service ACCESS EIBVALON........vvicceeei it e va e 16
Section 404.3 Smokeproof ENCIOSUNES ...........ccccoivinmiine e seees st ee e eeeeeeee s 16
Section 4046 ENclosure of AtriUMS...........ccceeeiioiriiin e e ssessetestse e e seeeesanenen 17
Section 405.8.15tandby Power LOAGS .....cccvvieeeeiceieeeeccieiee e s e s se s essesssaseens 17
Section 405.9.1 Emergency Power LOAAS .......o.uvecviireieeereeecceesee e e e e e ereseen 7
Section406.3. 2 AreaNCrEase. .......cccuieceeecercereere et et s s e eneeenneen 18
Section 40634 SePAratioN ........coieiieeiiieiiesicee e et ss s e se s s et eseeeeneassessmneeeseeane 18
Section 4064.5.1 FloOr DrAiNS......c.uccuviveeeeieeeiiiseeeeieeeeeneseeesrsessetsessssnssssenessssessssns 19
Section406.6.2VEentiBHON..........c...oocieieiecee et s s e e e e vanes 19
Section 406.8.2 VentiBtioN.............ccoevcenviniiiiiec e sertee et e e e e s e renereesenseeans 20
Section 406 83.1FI00F DrainNs .......vccvviiieeeiiee e crs e creerseaeessesrsst e e semeeesnssanes 20
Section 410.3.4 ProsceniUmMWAall .........ccouiiiiiiiieiceeeeiieie e e ee e essesesnasnenssenees 20
Section 410.3.5. TACHVALION.......cccoiiereecicie ettt ere e s s se e s s eeeaeeeeeeeeerean 20
Section 410.7 Automatic SprinkIerSYStemM ..........cociievecevceeeeececerscsstesseeeeemeeeesennes 21
Amend Section 410.7 deleting Exception No. 1and modifying Exception No. 2, as

TOIOWS: ..ottt sen e be st eaesaeeee e e e e sa e e seeseneeseeenesaenes 21
SeCtion 412,48 Fire SUPPrESSION......cccceeeecerrivsesteeseersseeaeesssessseseeseenesssssstsssessesnees 21
Section 419.5 Fire Protection ... cceesest s s ere s e e s e e ee e senes 21

Page 3 of 82



SECHON 4206 VISUA] ACCESS........ccccvieeeeeeeerteeisereesressstesssareseeesesssssssssesasssss sosesssessee sessssnsnson 21

SeCtoN 4215 VENTIBHON. .....ccoiieeieeeeeriereee et se s st eeaeesn e e sneanesaeennn 21
Section607.2 Group F-20rS-2, 0Ne SOV ..c.couvieeeceeeeere et er e 22
Section 607.3 Sprinklered, ONE STOTY ..........cuieereiiiri e eeee e sesesseseesseseeesne s e seees s e 22
Section 703.4 Automatic SPHNKIBIS...........ccceeeesccceceeniemiesississseeresesssssssessseesssesssessasassssssssnssaes 23
SeCtion 7094 CONINUEY .....oveieeeeceececcae sttt sr e st seeesesmesee e e s esssessessesesssmesssesseeen 23
Section 713.13.3 Refuse, Recycling and Laundry Chute Access ROOMS........cceevuveeverennnnns 24
Section 713.13.4 Termination ROOM ......ccuceuieiieeeiiicieci e eeeeeeee s eeesessneese e s e eees 24
Section 716.6.9 DOOK CIOSING..........oriereee i st eeeeeeere e e eer e e tee s e e st eseaeeesseeseesnees 24
Section 7183.2 Groups R-1,R-2, R-3, aNU R ......ceoreeirieieeeeeeeeeeeeeeseeeseeeessseesssee e s 25
Section 71842 Groups R-TANA R-2......cccccmiumireeeeeieeeeeessesisese s scese e eeesesssesse s esseseesnssnns 26
Section 718.5 Combustible Materials in Concealed Spaces in Type lor ||

CONSIUCHION. ... e e 26

Section 803.112 Set-Out CONSITUCHION.......ccceceeieceee i s eeeeseseseseessnessssnessnssreeas 26
Section 803.13.1 Site-Fabricated Stretch Celling SYstems .....coueevveeevciiie v ceeeeeeee e 27
Section 806.1GENETAl MEQUITEIMEBNTS.........cceeeeeeeeer e crersieererserersesssssssessessssmssesss esssosessesseessene 27
Section 903.2 WhEre REQUITEM ........c.eeeeeeeieeeeeeecieeesesseseeeseesse e esessesesssesssss s seses sesesesesesses 27
BectioN 903 23 GroUPE ...ttt ettt et e et enans 28
SeCtion 903.2.8 GrOUP Ru....oiciirireieineie st ess s essss s sses st saas st essereseasssssesnenssesesennes 28
Section 903.3 Nstallation REQUIFEMENES ........ceeieeieeiese e e reeeeeece e e eee e sneesesssesstseese e 29
Section 9034 Sprinkler system supervision and @larms ........coc.ccoceveeeeveeeeeeeeeeeeeeeseranes 29
Section 905.3THEIGIL. ..o s e e e s e e et eneeeen 29
Section 9059 VAIVE SUPEIVISION .....c.cccecviircieiriiseiesii e esssseasses seneessesasssesnesss seessssessemssnes 29
SeCHON 0B, TGENEIAL. ..ot e s e e s e s sn e senae s st aneaesensenn 29
Section 9072.7.10ccupant NOtifiCatioN .........c.cceeeeeieieeiiiticie e et sssessseseeas 30
Section 907 2.13 High-Rise BUIAINGS .........cccceeeeeitieeiieereeseseiiees e ceeee s sessesseesesns 30
Section 907 2.13.1.1Area SMOKe DEteCtON ......cocevuivceireiieicee et eeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeaesesesseeseens 30
Section 907.3 Fire Safety FUNCHONS ... csess s ssesse s s s sevessssasee s semeesnas 31

Section 907.4 NtIAtNG DEVICES ........cccevereiieiiieiesseiieis s sesreseses s esessessssessssssasssesssssesssnes 31

Section 9075 Occupant Notfication SySemMS........cccveeeeeeeeeeireeeeeeeeeereeeseseeseeseee s sesssssnens 31

Section 9078 INSAIHON .........cecciiirccrr et eb e s e e s ene e 31

Section 909.5.2 OPeniNg ProtOCON............ccveeeiieiiiieree e ereeeeeeae e eeessssseessesseeseessrssnssnss 31

Section 909.16 Fire-Fighter's Smoke Control Panel.................coueeeeeeveeeeseeseesseeesnnons 32
Section 909.17 System RESPONSE TiME............cccevreieireieiisesisirceee e esessessssesssessssessssessanes 32
Section 909.18.8.3 REPOMS ......c.cceiuiereicereeee e cetserisecesreeesesssseere s seessesesssssssesesses e e seeeseeeaes 33
Section 909.18.10 Alternative TestNg Method..........coeeeeeeeeeeeieeeseeeeeeee e e e esesnss 33
Section 909.20 SMOKEProof ENCIOSUIES......c...ceereeresiarserseoremsesesessessesssssessesessssessess e sesseesens 33

Page 4 of 92



Section 909.20.5.1 Dampered Relief OPening.........cceeeeeeeeveerseeeeeeeeeceeeeeeseeesseeens.s 34

SOCHON 011,13 SIZE ettt re e st e e e e e e s eresen e s eesee e 34
SeCtioN 916 Fire RISEr ROOM ....cucerietieeieieecceiraeesieneceeeeeesaeseneeseses et seveseesnesneesrssn e 34
Section 1006.3 Emergency Power for Iumination.................o.ooovoeeoeeeeeeeeeeeeeenn 34
Section 1008.1.5 FIoor ERVALION. ........covuureie e eeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeesee e eeeesessseeeeeens 35
Section 1008.1.8 DoOr ArraNGEMENL. .....cveeeeeneeirrieneeeeeeee e eeeeeeeeee et 35
Section 1008.1.9.11 Stairway DOOIS......ceccereiiineeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeerarreeseesee e senens 36
Section 1011.2 Floor-Leve! Ext Signs in Group R-1 37
Table 1014.3 COMMON PATH OF EGRESS TRAVEL .......oveeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeees e 37
Section 1015.1 Exits or Exit Access Doorways from SpacesS.............cocvveeeeeeevrennnn. 37
Section 1016.2.2 Three or More Exis or Ext Access DOoOrways ...........coeeeveeeeeeennnn, 38
Section 10164 Corridor NCreASES .......cecueiieeeeeierieeeneeeeeeeeeeeteeeseeeeees s eeerneseenees 38
Section 1022.4 OPeNINGS. . s ecvestrimneamecel s erereeeeereenreerereessaesseasessssensns 38
Section 1028.6.2.3 AUtOMALiC SPHNKIETS ......eooieecrceeeeeeeeireseeeeseessseeseeeeeeeses 39
Section 1109.16 Gaming Machines and Tables...........ccccovvveernreeeeereerereeeeeeseieses 39
Section 1203.1 GENETAL.........ccieiiieeee ettt eeee e eerereee s e eeeseseeeeeseseeeeessn 40
Section 1203.4.1Ventilation Area REQUINEd .......eeeeeeeeieeeereereeeesesveeeseeeeeeeeeeeeseesne. 40
Section 12034.2.1 BathrOOMS . .....eeccceviveiirreeceeemeeeeeeeceeeeeeeareeessennseessnssnessssanns 40
Section 1203.6 Mechanical Ventilation .............cueceueeeeeceerereeerireeeeseeereseesseesessnns 41
Section 16803 1GENEIAL....ccc.eieiriiiee et cer e ee e s e e eeeser e eessmeeeas 42
Section 1609.1.1 Determination of Wind LOadS.........ccccvvreeeumeeeeeeririresieeeeeeeesessnns 42
Section 1612.3 Establishment of Flood Hazard Areas............cccocoeeeeeeeeeeeveesnennn 43
SCON TBT13.1 8COPE o eeieiei it ettt et e eeeeeeeeee st e e e e ereneeaes 44
Section 1613.3.2 Site Class DefiNiONS .........ccovereeeeeecerererieeeeeeeeeereeessesneeeessnrses 44
Section 170424 RepOrt REQUITEMENL ........cceuueeereeeeeeeeeiriereneeeeesesseserseesseessees 45
Section 1704.4 Contractor Responsibility ...........c..eeeeevrerireeeermeeeeeeereereeseeseeresennns 45
Section 1704.5.1 Structural Observations for Seismic Resistance...............coo......... 46
Section 1705.3 Concrete CONSIIUCHON ........eiveeeeeieevitreeeeeseeeeeeeemeeeeeevesnes s s 46
Section 1705.4 Masonry CONSTUCHON ...........oceieureeteeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeersenrerseseseesnans 47
SeCHON 1705.8 SOIS ...eeiiecrriiiee ettt ra e e ree e eeeeee e eeeeaee e ereeseeeeenns 47
Table T708.6 ... o et s e vt e s e e e e e e e eae e eate e 48
REQURED VERIFICATION AND NSPECTION OF SOILS .....coveeceeeeeereeeeeeeeeeveaseasnnes 48
Section 1705.15 Exterior Insulation and Finish Systems (EFS).........c.cocoevuenne......, 48
Section 1705.18 Amusement and transportation systems special cases.................. 49
Section 1803.2 Investigations REQUIFEd ..........oovureeeeeeeeirieeeeeesvesee e eeseeeeeeeens 49
Section 1803.3.2 Mnimum Expioration ReqUIreMEnts .............eeeeeeeeeeeeveersessonnsions 49

Page 5 of 92



Section 1803.53 EXPANSIVE SOil......coioeieeeceeeereireeece et veesese vt ssessesss s s s eeseeeeeeeesmeseneeneen 50

Section 18035.8 Compacted Fill Material............cooveviieiiearieieteeeereee s esesseeeeeesessessesssnes 51
Section 1803.6 REPOMING. ......ccocce e v reee et ccre sttt et r e e se st s s e e smeseeesemsamnneesms e 51
Section 18043 Site GradiNg.....cccccceceiiiieriiiieeiee s sb e eeeeessreseeeseseeveeeemaesesenessnessssnesnes 53
Section 1804.3.1 Low Collapsible and LoW Soluble S0il........ccccomvvevverereeerressssserseseesasn 54
Section 1804.5 Compacted Fill MALEIal. .............ccviieviieiie it res e e e eeeeseene e seeses s 54
SECtON 1805.2. TFIOONS ....cocieierericciertec e seeer s saessse e e a s se s e ss s vas s s st s emees e e e s aeensensernnsens 54
Section 1807.23 Safety FACION ........ccceiiverniicnii i ecresee s s reese e ar e er e resssssvesanssessseesas 54
Section 1807.24 Slope Stability An@IYSIS .......cccveveriineicriece e rrcesiires st e e esessnesssesessees 55
Section 1808.6.1.1 Minimum Foundation Depth in Expansive SoilS ..........ccevoovveevivveeennnn 56
TabIE. 1B0B.6. 1.1, e ettt e e ———————————— e e s 56
MNMUM THICKENED EDGE OR FOUNDATION DEPTH ... eese s s seeseesrensenan, 55
Section 1808.62 Slab-on-Ground Foundations .......ccuueeieeeeeeecsmisecsesnssissssrsssseeseeseeseeres 55
Table 1808.62 Post Tensioned SIab Crteria ...........cccvieeecrnienieesieenissnsisscie s eceeseesseseanes 56
CHLICAL 2 ..ot et s s e e s e s mseeaee s s b eeesennesssee s snsnnssen 56
Section 1808.87 Use of Non-Structural Slabs on Ground to ResistBearingLoads ......... 57
Section 1808.10 Minimum Distance to Ground Faulting...........c.ccv.o... 4 vernrrreneerne e 57
Section 1809.4 Depth and Width of FOOUNGS......cccvecciinieicsisrcemesesseis s setesss e sreeresnresnesens 57
Section 1904.2 Concrete ProOPerlies........ccvccrieereiiirrii s cir e eecessssestsssessenssssesssesnsssnns 58
Section 1905.19 AC| 318, SeCHON D,33 ......cooiiiieciriierseciessarssersvesesssessssssesessasesesssnsssnas 58
Section 1905.1.10 ACI 318, Section D4.22............ccovivimreniniieeresree s cesssessesssessssnessasnns 59
SeCtion 1907.1GENEIAL ....ocociiiriecerriecirr vttt ae s e e sr s s s e s s st b e seemeseeearerssenans 59
Section 2304.9 Connectors and Fasteners.......c.ccivivrreenseniei st cs s s s s ea e nes 60
Section 2304.98 Bottom (sill) plate anChorage .............nnineseise e cee s e eseenees 60
Section 230898 Pipes INWAlS ......c.ccoireririiirirer s rree s ssesrsrsrees s e sb s s raeesssbs s sssgena 60
Section 26067 Light-Diffusing SYSIEMS .......cceceieceicecieeiii e snes e enas 60
Section 2611 Light-Transmitting Plastic Interior Signs..............  werrersemreerresnvans snsenners 01
Section 2612 Fber-Reinforced POWMEr ..........cociieeeiieieieerceicinssce e seeensenssessssssssessesesas 62
Section 2902.2 Separate FACHItEs ..........c.oceciceressscscsesisssssessssi s st ssenesese sessasesesseasenss 63
Section 3002.4 Elevator Car To Accommodate Ambulance Stretcher..............ccccveeinene. 64
Section 3003.13 TWO Or MOre EIRVALONS ........cccceeecerrieniriricec e cse vt essisas s ses s sssscsesenene 64
SeCHON 3112 CADANAS ....cceiueererrei e iee s esesier s st et s ne v as e s e be e s s s enessneseasacsensen 64
Section 3113 Shade StrUCIUIES........cvi et ssrs e s as e seseessesnseesnessan 66
Section 3306.2 WAIKWAYS ..........cceccrermermereme e e senescessessesssssssssassssssseseseersassesssnsessessassenssssars 69
Section 3401.7 Automatic Sprinkler Systems in Existing BUildings ..........cc.vcouvevrmveeuennn.. 69
Section 340138 Fire Alarm Systems in Existing Buildings..........c.ccoeeienieeseseescsesecsesnenns 72

Page 6 of 92



Section 3405 2 Substantial Structural Damage To Vertical Elernents Of The Lateral

Force. ResiStNg SYSIeM.......c.ccivice et 74
Section 3405.3.1 Lateral Force-ResiSting EIRMENtS ..........ceeveevveoveeeeeoeeeeeeeeoeosons 74
Section HIO7 1.3 Area LIMEAtON ........c.ccooviivieieeeeeereeeeesseeseeeeee e ee oo ee s oo 74
APPENAIX JGFAAING. .....ovtreeeee et ee e eee e et srre st eeseesees e smsemser s st e eee s s 75
Section J102. 1DEfiNIONS ........ccvueereercriresoee e eereeeeeeeeereesesee s eee et e ee e e st s s e e e 75
SeCtiON JI03.3HAZAIGS ..........oiviueceeeceieceeec e ste e e eee et e ee et sttt ses 76
Section J104.1SUbmittal reQUIREMENES .....coceeeeeeeee et 76
Section J1042 Grading plan reqUIreMENtS ............ooeeeeeecereeeeeeee e oo eeeeeeoe oo 77
Section J104.3 GeotechniCal REPOM.........coveireeeeeeeeeeeeeeee s ee e s et 78
J1043 Geotechnical report. A geotechnkal report prepared by a registered design
professional

shall be provided. The report shall comply with Section 1803.6 .......cocoovvvvevveeenn, 78
SeCtioN J105 INSPECHONS ......coveieieeeeec et e e e e e e et et e et e e ee e e 78
Appendix N Fences,Walls and RetainingWalls ............ccccoovveeeeeeeeeeeeeee e eeeeesn s 81
e = O O OO 81
FENCES,WALLS AND RETAINNG WALLS.........ccocorieeeeeerseeeeseeerseeesssseesess e 81
APPENAIX-0 ...ttt et e et e s e e er et et e e et et et e e et e 84
GUDELNES FOR EVALUATING LRQUEFACTION HAZARDS NNEVADA ......oooooooon. 84
Appendix P Guidelines for Evaluating Potential Surface Fauk Rupture/Land Subsidence
HAZArds in NEVAUA ...ttt st ee e ee e sttt s 91
GUDELINES FOR EVALUATING POTENTIAL SURFACE FAULT RUPTURE/LAND
SUBSDENCE HAZARDS N NEVADA ..........ccocverintieeeeeeeeseeseeestsseesssses s sesossssessssens 91

Page 7 of 92



Chapter 1 - Administrative

Delete Sections 103 through 116 in their entirety

Section 202 Definitions
Amend Section 202 to add or amend the following definitions to read as follows:

BABY CHANGING TABLE. A table or other device that is safe and sanitary for
changing the diaper of a child age 3 or under.

BUILDING PAD. The soil, cut or fill site, outlined by the area of the footprint of the
building plus a minimum of 5 additional feet (1529 mm) to the exterior. This includes any
type of foundation system for the structure,

CABANA. A structure used for temporary shelter, comfort and privacy of occupants
located on, or in close proximity to, a building. Cabanas shail not be used for retail
sales, bar service, food preparation, storage, or overnight sleeping.

CABANA GROUP. A group of individual cabanas that are not separated from each
other as required by Section 3114. The total area of the cabana group shall be used to
determine code requirements for all cabanas contained within the cabana group.

CERTIFY. Use of the word “certify” or “certification” constitutes an expression of
professional opinion regarding those facts or findings which are the subject of the
certification.

ELECTRIC VEHICLE CHARGING STATION. One or more dedicated parking spaces
that are provided to accommodate charging of electric motor vehicles.

FAULT. A fracture or zone of fracturing in geologic materials (soil or rock) along which
there has been displacement of the sides relative to one another parailel to the fracture.

FAULT, HOLOCENE ACTIVE. A fault with recognized activity within Holocene time
(within the past 11,000 years).

FAULT, QUATERNARY ACTIVE. A fault with recognized activity within Quaternary
time (within the past 1.6 million years).

FAULT INACTIVE. A fault without recognized activity within Quaternary time {within the
past 1.6 million years).

FINAL GRADING REPORT. A grading report stamped and signed by a registered
design professional certifying that the building pad was constructed in conformance with
the recommendations set forth in the geotechnical report. This report contains explicit
information and data that verifies compliance with the geotechnical report of record
including any approved supplements or addendums.

[F] FIRE CODE OFFICIAL. The fire chief or other designated authority charged with the

administration and enforcement of the Infernational Fire Code, or a duly authorized
representative,

Page 8 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



GRADING. An excavation, inclusive of clearing and grubbing of vegetation, or fill or
combination thereof.

GEOTECHNICAL REPORT (SOILS REPORT). Data and engineering
recommendations resulting from site exploration which evaluates the soil conditions and
general site characteristics and suitability of the site for the proposed construction. A
registered design professional shall prepare and seal the report,

HIGH-RISE BUILDING. A building with an occupied floor located more than 55 feet (17
m) above the lowest level of fire department vehicle access.

INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE. The Energy Conservation Code
as amended and adopted by the local jurisdiction.

INTERNATIONAL EXISTING BUILDING CODE. The Existing Building Code as
amended and adopted by the local jurisdiction.

INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE. The Fire Code as amended and adopted by the local
jurisdiction.

INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE. The Fuel Gas Code as amended and adopted by
the local jurisdiction.

INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE. The Mechanical Code as amended and
adopted by the local jurisdiction.

INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE. The Plumbing Code as amended and adopted
by the local jurisdiction.

INTERNATIONAL PRIVATE SEWAGE DISPOSAL CODE. The Private Sewage
Disposal Code as amended and adopted by the local jurisdiction.

INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE. The Property Maintenance
Code as amended and adopted by the local jurisdiction.

INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE. The Residential Code as amended and
adopted by the local jurisdiction.

INTERNATIONAL WILDLAND-URBAN INTERFACE CODE. The Wildland-Urban
Interface Code as amended and adopted by the local jurisdiction

PAD CERTIFICATION REPORT. An interim grading report stamped and signed by a
registered design professional certifying that the building pad currently is in conformance
with the recommendations set forth in the geotechnical report of record.

PAD RECERTIFICATION REPORT. A report stamped and signed by a registered
design professional certifying that the building pad currently is in conformance with the
recommendations set forth in the geotechnical report of record. This report contains
explicit information and data that verifies compliance to the geotechnical report of record
including any approved supplements or addendums.

REFUSAL. Refusal while advancing an exploration is recognized as defined by ASTM
D 1586.

Page 9 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



SHADE STRUCTURE. A structure with not less than 50 percent of its perimeter wall
area unenclosed, has no interior partitions, and provides solar or weather protection for
uses accessory to a building of any occupancy. Shade structures shall not apply to
cabanas, canopies, roof structures over vehicle drive-through lanes (porte-cocheres),
parking facilities, playground structures, or industrial uses.

SHADE STRUCTURE GROUP. A group of individual shade structures that are not
separated from each other by a minimum distance of 10 feet (3048 mm), as measured
from the nearest horizontal projection. The total area of the shade structure group shall
be used to determine code requirements for all shade structures within the shade
structure group.

SPECIAL GEOTECHNICAL CONSIDERATION AREA. A portion of Clark County
where additional geotechnical investigation requirements may apply. These areas are
identified on the most recent edition of the “Clark County Soil Guidelines Reference
Map(s)” as published by Clark County.

STRUCTURAL/GEOTECHNICAL OBSERVATION. The visual observation of the
structural system encompassing the structure, foundation elements and the bearing or
supporting soils of the foundation elements by a registered design professional for
general conformance to the approved construction documents. Structural observation
does not include or waive the responsibility for the inspection required by Section 110,

Section 305.2.3
Amend Section 305.2.3 to read as follows:

305.2.3 Six or fewer children in a dwelling unit. A facility such as the above within a
dwelling unit and having six-or fewer children receiving such day care shall be classified
as a Group R-3 occupancy or shall comply with the International Residential Code.

Section 308.5
Amend Section 308.5 to read as follows:

308.5 Institutional Group |4, day care facilities. Institutional Group |-4 occupancy
shall include buildings and structures occupied by more than six _persons of any age who
receive custodial care for fewer than 24 hours per day by persons other than parents or
guardians, relatives by blood, marriage or adoption, and in a place other than the home
of the person cared for. This group shall include, but not be limited to, the following:
Adult day care
Child day care

308.5.1 Classification as Group E. A child day care facility that provides care
for more than six but no more than 100 children 2% years or less of age, where
the rooms in which the children are cared for are located on a leve! of exit
discharge serving such rooms and each of these child care rooms has an exif
door directly to the exterior, shall be classified as Group E.

308.5.3 Six or fewer persons recelving care. A facility having six or fewer

persons receiving custodial care shall be classified as part of the primary
occupancy.

Page 10 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



308.5.4 Six or fewer persons receiving care in a dwelling unit. A facility such
as the above within a dwelling unif and having six or fewer persons receiving
custodial care shall be classified as a Group R-3 occupancy or shall comply with
the Infernational Residential Code.

Section 310.3
Amend Section 310.3 to read as follows:

310.3 Residential Group R-2. Residential Group R-2 occupancies containing sleeping
units or more than two dwelling units where the occupants are primarily permanent in
nature, including:
Apariment houses
Condominiums {nontransient)
Congregate living facilities (nontransient) with more than 16 occupants
Boarding houses (nontransient)
Convents
Dormitories
Fraternities and sororities
Monasteries
Hotels (nontransient)
Live/work units
Motels (nontransient)
Vacation timeshare properties

Section 310.4
Amend Section 310.4 to read as follows:

310.4 Residential Group R-3. Residential Group R-3 occupancies where the occupants
are primarily permanent in nature and not classified as Group R-1, R-2, R4 or |,
including:
Buildings that do not contain more than two dwelling units
Care facilities that provide accommodations for six or fewer persons receiving
care
Congregate living facilities (nontransient) with 16 or fewer occupants
Boarding houses (nontransient)
Convents
Dormitories
Fraternities and sororities
Monasteries
Congregate living facilities (transient) with 10 or fewer occupants
Boarding houses (transient)
Lodging houses (transient) with five or fewer guest rooms and 10 or fewer
occupants

310.4.1 Care facilities within a dwelling. Care facilities for six or fewer persons
receiving care that are within a single-family dwelling are permitted to comply
with the International Residential Code provided an automatic sprinkler system is
installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.3 or with Section P2904 of the
International Residential Code.

Section 403.3

Amend Section 403.3 to read as follows:

Page 11 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



[F] 403.3 Automatic sprinkler system. Buildings and structures shall be equipped
throughout with an automatic sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 and
a secondary water supply where required by Section 403.3.3.

Exception: An automatic sprinkler system shall not be required in
parking garages in accordance with Section 406.5.

Section 407.4,7
Amend Section 407.4.7 by adding subsections that read as follows:

403.4.7.1 Design requirements. Smoke removal systems shall be capable of manual
activation and shall be designed in accordance with Sections 403.4.7.1.1 through
403.4.71.4.

403.4.7.1.1 Fans. Fans shall be selected for stable performance based on
normal temperature, Calculations and manufacturer’s fan curves shall be part of
the documentation procedures. Fans shall be supported and restrained by
noncombustible devices in accordance with the requirements of Chapter 16.

403.4.7.1.1.1 Fan belts. Belt-driven fans shall have 1.5 times the number
of belts required for the design duty, with the minimum number of belts
being two.

403.4.7.1.1.2 Fan motors. Motors driving fans shall not be operated
beyond their nameplate horsepower (kilowatis), as determined from
measurement of actual current draw, and shall have a minimum service
factor of 1.15.

403.4.7.1.2 Ducts. Ducts shall be constructed and supported in accordance with
the International Mechanical Code. Exhaust ducts shall be leak tested to 1.5
times the maximum design pressure in accordance with nationally accepted
practices. Measured leakage shall not exceed 5 percent of design flow. Results
of such testing shall be a part of the special inspections report in accordance with
Section 403.4.7.3.3.

Exception: Leakage testing shall not be required where the exhaust
ducts are contained completely within the smoke removal zone they
serve.

403.4.7.1.3 Power. The smoke removal system shall be supplied with two
sources of power. Primary power shall be from the normal building power
systems. Secondary power shali be from an approved standby source complying
with Chapter 27 of this code.

Exception: Secondary power for the smoke removal system is not
required where hormal power can be automatically restored from the fire
command center following a normal power shunt.

403.4.7.1.3.1 Standby power source enclosure. The standby power
source and its transfer switches shall be in a room separate from the
normal power transformers and switch gears and ventilated directly to
and from the exterior. The room shall be enclosed with not less than 1-

Page 12 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



hour fire barriers constructed in accordance with Section 707 or horizontal
assemblies constructed in accordance with Section 711, or both.

403.4.7.1.3.2 Power sources and power surges. Elements of the
smoke removal system relying on volatile memories shall be supplied with
uninterruptable power sources of sufficient duration to span a 15-minute
primary power interruption. Elements of the smoke removal system
susceptible to power surges shall be suitably protected by conditioners,
suppressors or other approved means.

403.4.7.1.3.3 Secondary power supply. The secondary power supply
shall be sized to accommodate the electrical requirements of the two
largest adjacent smoke removal zones simultaneously.

403.4.7.1.4 Status indicators and controls. Status indicators and controls for
the smoke removal system shall be provided on a graphic control panel in the fire
command center. The graphic control panel shail be designed in accordance with
the International Fire Code and shall provide status of smoke removal fans and
controls for the smoke removai systems. The control panel for the smoke
removal system shall be permitted to operate through the building HVAC
management system or the fire alarm system. The control pane! for the smoke
removal system shall not be required to be listed as smoke control equipment.

403.4.7.2 Control diagrams. The construction documents shall provide sufficient
information and detail to adequately describe the elements of the design necessary for
the proper implementation of the smoke removal systems. The construction documents
shall include smoke removal system control diagrams that show all devices in the
system and identify their location and function. The smoke removal system drawings
shall be permitted to be combined with smoke control system drawings, where
applicable. Approved copies of the smoke removal system control diagrams shall be
maintained current and kept on file with the Authority Having Jurisdiction and in the fire
command center in an approved format and manner.

403.4.7.3 Special inspections for smoke removal, Smoke removal systems shall be
tested by a special inspector.

Exception: Special inspections shall not be required where smoke removal is
achieved by natural ventilation in accordance with Section 403.4.7, ltem 1.

403.4.7.3.1 Scope of testing. Special inspections shall be conducted in
accordance with the following:

1. During erection of ductwork and prior to concealment for the purposes
of ieakage testing and recording device location,
2. Prior to occupancy and after sufficient completion for the purposes of

exhaust air change rate measurements and control verification.

403.4.7.3.2 Qualifications. Special inspection agencies for smoke removal shall
have expertise in fire protection engineering, mechanical engineering and
certification as air balancers.

403.4.7.3.3 Reports. A complete report of testing shall be prepared by the
special inspector or special inspection agency. The report shall include
identification of all devices by manufacturer, nameplate data, design values,
measured values and identification tag or mark. The report shall be reviewed by
the responsible registered design professional and, when satisfied that the

Page 13 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



design intent has been achieved, the responsible registered design professional
shall seal, sign and date the report with a statement as follows:

“I have reviewed this report and by personal knowledge and on-site observation
certify that the smoke removal system is in substantial compliance with the
design intent, and to the best of my understanding complies with the
requirements of the code.”

403.4.7.3.3.1 Report filing. A copy of the final report shall be filed with
the Authority Having Jurisdiction and an identical copy shall be
maintained in the fire command center.

Section 403.5.3

Amend Section 403.5.3 to read as follows:

403.5.3 Stairway door operation. Stairway doors other than the exit discharge doors
shall be permitted to be locked from stairway side. Stairway doors that are locked from
the stairway side shall be unlocked simultaneously without unlatching upon any of the
following: a signal from the fire command center; activation of a fire alarm signal in an
area served by the stairway; or failure of the power supply.

Exception: Upon approval of the building official, stairway doors opening directly
into privately owned residential units or leased tenant spaces are permitted to unlock
without unlatching only upon signal from the fire command center.

Section 403.5.4
Amend Section 403.5.4 to read as follows:
403.5.4 Smokeproof enclosures. Every required interior exit stairway serving floors

more than 55 feet (17 m) above the lowest level of fire department vehicle access shall be a
smokeproof enclosure in accordance with 909.20 and 1023.11

Section 403.6.1

Amend Section 403.6.1 to read as follows:

403.6.1 Fire service access elevator. In buildings with an occupied floor more than
120 feet (36 576 mm) above the lowest level of fire department vehicle access, not fewer
than two fire service access elevators, or all elevators, whichever is less, shall be
provided in accordance with Section 3007. Each fire service access elevator shall have
a capacity of not less than 3500 pounds (1588 kg) and shall comply with Section 3002.4.

Exception: Where a building is provided with multiple ambulance stretcher sized
elevator cars in accordance with Section 3002.4 and the table below, fire service
access elevators shall not be required.

Table 403.6.1
Ambulance Stretcher Sized Elevator Cars

Page 14 of 82 Dated: July 3, 2018



Highest floor level served above lowest level Number of elevator cars sized to

of fire department access in feet (meters) accommodate an ambulance stretcher *
120-599 (36.6m-182.6m) 3

600-899 (182.9m-274.0m) 4

800 and greater (274.3m) 5

® A fire service access elevator installed in accordance with Section 403.6.1 shall be
permitted to substitute for one of these elevators,

Section 404.3
Amend Section 404.3, deleting exceptions 1 and 2, to read as follows:

[F] 404.3 Automatic sprinkler protection. An approved automatic sprinkler system
shall be installed throughout the entire building.

Section 404.6
Amend Section 404.6 fo read as follows:

404.6 Enclosure of atriums. Afrium spaces shall be separated from adjacent spaces by
a 1-hour fire barrier constructed in accordance with Section 707 or a horizontal assembly
constructed in accordance with Section 711, or both.

Exceptions:

1. A fire barrier is not required where a glass wall forming a smoke partition is
provided. The glass wall shall comply with all of the following:

1.1 A separately zoned system of automatic sprinklers is provided along
both sides of the separation wall and doors, or on the room side only if
there is not a walkway on the afrium side. The sprinklers shall be
located between 4 inches and 12 inches (102 mm and 305 mm}) away
from the glass and at intervals along the glass not greater than 6 feet
(1828 mm). The sprinkler system shall be designed so that the entire
surface of the glass is wet upon activation of the sprinkler system
without obstruction;

1.2The glass wall shall be installed in a frame In a manner that the
framing system deflects without breaking (ioading) the glass before
the sprinkler system operates; and
1.3 Unchanged
(Exceptions 2 -4 unchanged)
Section 406.3.3

Amend Section 406.3.3 to read as follows:

Page 15 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



406.3.3 Carports. Carports shall be open on not fewer than two sides. Carports open on
fewer than two sides shall be considered a garage and shall comply with the requirements
for private garages.

406.3.3.1 Carport separation. Separations shall comply with the following:

1. A separation is not required between a Group R-3 and U carport, provided that
the carport is entirely open on two or more sides and there are not enclosed
areas above.

3. When a Group B, F, M, R, or S occupancy structure and a noncombustible
carport are located on the same property with a minimum separation of ten feet
(3048 mm) between the structure and the carport, as measured from the roof
edges, exterior wall and opening protection are not required for either structure.

Section 410.2.4

Amend Section 410.2.4 to read as follows:

410.2.4 Proscenium wall. Where the stage height is greater than 50

feet (15 240 mm), all portions of the stage shall be completely separated from the
seating area by a proscenium wall with not less than a 2-hour fire-resistance rating
extending continuously from the foundation to the roof.

Exception: Where a stage is located in a building of Type | construction, the proscehium
wall is permitted to extend continuousty from a minimum 2-hour fire-resistance-rated
floor slab of the space containing the stage to the roof or a minimum 2-hour fire-
resistance-rated floor deck above. This exception shall not apply to buildings of Type IB
construction in which the minimum fire-resistance ratings of the building elements in
Table 601 have been reduced in accordance with Section 403.2.1.1.

Section 410.2.5

Amend Section 410.2.5 to read as follows:
410.2.5 Proscenium Curtain. When provided, a fire curtain shall be activated by
manual emergency operation, fusible link, rate-of-rise heat detection installed in
accordance with Section 907.3 operating at a rate of temperature rise of 15 to 20°F per
minute (8 to 11°C per minute), or signal of water flow from any automatic sprinkler
system covering the stage as required by Section 410.6.

Section 410.6

Amend Section 410.6 to read as follows:
[F] 410.6 Automatic sprinkler system. Stages shall be equipped with an aufomatic
sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1. Sprinklers shall be installed
under the roof and gridiron and under all catwalks and galleries over the stage.
Sprinklers shall be installed in dressing rooms, performer lounges, shops and
storerooms accessory to such stages.

Exceptions:

Page 16 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



1. Sprinklers are not required for stages 1,000 square feet (93 m2) or less in area
and 50 feet (15 240 mm) or less in height where curtains, scenery or other
combustible hangings are not retractable vertically. Combustible hangings shall
be limited to a singie main curtain, borders, legs and a single backdrop.

2. Sprinkiers are not required within portable orchestra enclosures on stages.

Section 412.3.6

Amend Section 412.3.6 by deleting the exception, to read as follows:

[F] 412.3.6 Fire suppression. Aircraft hangars shall be provided with a fire suppression
system designed in accordance with NFPA 408, based upon the classification for the
hangar given in Table 412.3.6.

Section 420.11
Amend Section 420.11 to read as follows:

420.11 Visual access. The primary entrance door of individual units in motels, hotels,
apartment houses, condominiums, and vacation timeshare properties shall contain a
means to allow the occupant to visually identify a visitor without opening the unit entry
door.

Section 503.1.4
Amend Section 503.4 to read as follows:

503.1.4 Occupied roofs. A roof level or portion thereof shall be permitted to be used as
an occupied roof provided the occupancy of the roof is an occupancy that is permitted by
Table 504.4 for the story immediately below the roof. The area of the occupied roofs
shall not be indluded in the building area as regulated by Section 506.

Exceptions:

1. The occupancy located on an occupied roof shall not be limited to the
occupancies allowed on the story immediately below the roof where the
building is equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system in
accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2 and occupant notification in
accordance with Section 907.5 is provided in the area of the occupied roof.

Section 504.4
Amend Section 504.4 to read as follows:

504.4 Number of Stories. The maximum number of stories of a building shail not
exceed the limits specified in Tabie 504.4,

Exception: In occupancies other than Groups E, F, H, and |, where a building of
Type I, I-A, or V-A construction is equipped throughout with an approved
automatic sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 and complies
with the high-rise provisions in accordance with Section 403, the values specified
in Table 504.4 for maximum allowable number of stories above grade plane is
increased by one.

Page 17 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



Section 507.3

Delete Section 507.3:
(507.3 intentionally left blank)

Section 507.4
Amend Section 507.4 to read as follows:

507.4 Sprinklered, one story. The area of a Group A4 building not more than one
story above grade plane of other than Type V construction, or the area of a Group B, F,
M or S building no more than one story above grade plane of any construction type, shall
not be limited where the building is provided with an automatic sprinkler system
throughout in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 and is surrounded and adjoined by
public ways or yards not less than 60 feet (18 288 mm) in width.

Exceptions:

Buildings and structures of Type | and Il construction for rack storage facilities
that do not have access by the public shall not be limited in height, provided that
such buildings conform to the requirements of Sections 507.4 and 903.3.1.1 and
Chapter 32 of the International Fire Code.

Section 507.14
Add new Section 507.14 to read as follows:

507.14 Noncombustible carports. Noncombustible carports may be of uniimited area
when they are open on all sides, not over twelve feet (3658 mm} in height, and located a
minimum of 5 feet (1524 mm) from any property line or assumed property line,
measured from the roof edge.

Section 703.4

Add an exception to read as follows:

Exception: A fire barrier, fire partition or smoke barrier may use non-rated glass and
automatic sprinklers to achieve up to a 1-hour fire-resistance rating when all of the following
are provided:

1. Automatic sprinklers are provided along both sides of the glazing and/or doors, or on the
room side only if there is not a walkway on one side. The sprinklers shall be located
between 4 inches and 12 inches (102 mm and 305 mm) away from the glass and at
intervals along the giass not greater than 6 feet (1829 mm). The sprinkler system shall
be designed so that the entire surface of the glass is wet upon activation of the
sprinklers system without obstruction;

1.1. The glass wall shall be installed in a gasketed frame in a manner that the framing
system deflects without breaking (loading) the glass before the sprinkler system
operates; and

1.2. Where giass doors are provided in the glass wall, they shall be either self-closing or
automatic-closing; and

Page 18 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



1.3. The sprinklers used to protect the glass wall and/or doors along the fire barrier, fire
partition or smoke barrier are served by systems separate from the sprinklers
protecting the room or space. The system shall be dedicated to those sprinklers
used to protect the fire barrier.

1.4. The fire partition or smoke barrier does not exceed a 1-hour fire-resistance rating.

1.5. Where used as a fire barrier, the fire barrier shall be limited to those separating
mixed occupancies not exceeding a 1-hour fire resistance rating.

Section 705.3
Add new exception to Section 705.3 to read as follows:
Exceptions:

1. (Remains unchanged)

2. (Remains unchanged)

3. At the discretion of the Building Official, multiple lots within a commercial subdivision
established in accordance with the Nevada Revised Statutes, may be considered a
single lot where approved reciprocal agreements are in place to maintain the building
and associated building service equipment.

Section 709.4

Revise Section 709.4 to read as follows:

709.4 Continuity. Smoke barriers shall form an effective membrane continuous from
outside wall to outside wall and from the top of the foundation or fioor/ceiling assembly
below to the underside of the floor or roof sheathing, deck or slab above, including
continuity through concealed spaces, such as those found above suspended ceilings,
and interstitial structural and mechanical spaces. The supporting construction shall be
protected to afford the required fire-resistance rating of the wall or floor supported in
buildings of other than Type IIB, IIIB or VB construction. Smoke barrier walls used to
separate smoke compartments shall comply with Sections 709.4.1. Smoke-barrier walls
used to enclose areas of refuge in accordance with Section 1009.6.4 or to enclose
elevator lobbies in accordance with Section 405.4.3, 3007.6.2, or 3009.6.2 shall comply
with Section 709.4.2. Smoke barrier walls used to form smoke control boundaries in
accordance with Section 909.5 shall comply with Section 709.4.3.

{Exception and subsections to remain unchanged)}

Add new Section 709.4.3 to read as follows:

709.4.3 Smoke barrier walls form smoke control boundaries. Smoke barrier walls
used to form smoke control boundaries in accordance with Section 909.5 are not
required to extend from outside wall to outside wall.

Section 712.1.3

Revise Section 712.1.3 to read as follows:

Page 19 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



712,1.3 Escalator openings. Where a building is equipped throughout with an
automatic sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1, vertical openings for
escalators shall be permitted in accordance with Section 7121.3.1, 712.1.3.2, or
712.1.3.3

712.1.3.1 Opening size. Protection by a draft curtain and closely spaced sprinklers in
accordance with NFPA 13 shall be permitted where the area of the vertical opening
between stories does not exceed twice the horizontal projected area of the escalator. In
other than Groups B and M, this application is limited to openings that do not connect
more than four stories.

712.1.3.2 Automatic shutters. Protection of the vertical opening by approved shutters
at every penetrated floor shall be permitted in accordance with this section. The shutters
shall be of noncombustible construction and have a fire-resistance rating of not less than
1.5 hours. The shutter shall be so constructed as to close immediately upon the
actuation of a smoke detector installed in accordance with Section 907.3 and shall
completely shut off the well opening. Escalators shall cease operation when the shutter
begins to close. The shutter shall operate at a speed of not more than 30 feet per minute
(152.4 mm/s) and shall be equipped with a sensitive leading edge to arrest its progress
where in contact with any obstacle, and to continue its progress on release therefrom.

712.1.3.3 Two-story openings. In other than Group I-2 or I-3 occupancies, vertical
openings between two stories may contain an escalator. Such interconnected stories
shall be separated from vertical openings and air transfer openings serving other floors
by construction conforming to Section 713 for shaft enciosures.

Section

Section 716.2.6.1 Door Closing

Revise Section 712.6.1 to read as follows:
716.2.6.1 Door closing. Fire doors in fire walls shall be latching and automatic-closing
in accordance with this section. Fire doors in other than fire walis shall be latching and
self- or automatic-closing in accordance with this section.
Exceptions:
1. Fire doors located in common walls separating sleeping units in
Group R-1 and between dwelling units of transient nature in Group R-
2 shall be permitted without automatic- or self-closing devices.
2. The elevator car doors and the associated hoistway enclosure doors
at the floor leve! designated for recall in accordance with Section
3003.2 shall be permitted to remain open during Phase | emergency
recall operation.
Section 718.5

Amend Section 718.5 to read as folfows:

Page 20 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



718.5 Combustible materials in concealed spaces in Type | or Il construction.
Combustible materials shall not be permitted in concealed spaces of buildings of Type |

or |l construction.

Exceptions:

1.
2.

Section 803.10.1

Combustible materials in accordance with Section 603,

Combustible materials exposed within plenums complying with the
Uniform Mechanical Code.

Class A interior finish materials classified in accordance with Section
803 where the concealed space is protected with fire sprinklers as
required by the Fire Code when fire sprinklers are required in the
building by another section in this code.

Combustible piping within partitions or shaft enclosures installed in
accordance with the provisions of this code.

Combustible piping within concealed ceiling spaces installed in
accordance with the Uniform Mechanical Code and the Uniform
Plumbing Code.

Combustible insulation and covering on pipe and tubing, installed in
concealed spaces other than plenums, complying with Section 720.7.

Revise 803.10.1 to read as follow:

Add a new Section 803.10.1 as follows:

803.10.1 Site-fabricated stretch ceiling systems. Where used as a dropped ceiling, the

following shall apply:

1. In Types | and Il construction, frames shall be of non-combustible materials.

2. Where automatic sprinkler protection in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 or
903.3.1.2 is required beneath the panel, core materials shall be of non-combustible

materials.

Section 803.15.2

Revise Section 803.15.2 fo read as follows:

803.15.2 Set-out construction. Where walls and ceilings are required to be of fire-
resistance-rated or noncombustible construction and walls are set out or ceilings are
dropped distances greater than specified in Section 803.15.1, noncombustible materials,
in accordance with Section 703.5, shall be used.

Exceptions:
1. Where interior finish materials are protected on both sides by an

automatic sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1

Page 21 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



2. Where interior finish materials are attached to noncombustible backing
or fuming strips installed as specified in Section 803.15.1.1.

3. Where concealed spaces constructed from materials are filled with
non-combustible insulation, or Class A mineral fiber insulation.

(The remainder of the section remains unchanged)

Section 806.1

Revise Section 806.1 item #4 to read as follows:
[F] 806.1 General.

4. The permissible amount of noncombustible decorative materials, including decorative
vegetation, shall not be limited.

Section 902

Revise Section 902 to read as folfows:

Section 902.1 Pump and riser room size. Where provided, fire pump rooms shall be
designed with adequate space for all equipment necessary for the installation, as
defined by the manufacturer, with sufficient working space around the stationary
equipment, Clearances around equipment to elements of permanent construction,
including other installed equipment and appliances, shall be sufficient to allow
inspection, service, repair or replacement without removing such elements of permanent
construction or disabling the function of a required fire-resistance-rated assembly. Fire
pump rooms shall be provided with doors and unobstructed passageways large enough
to allow removal of the largest piece of equipment.

902.1.1 Access. Fire pumps and controllers shall be provided with ready access. Where
located in a pump room, the door shall be permitted to be locked provided that the key is
available at all times.

902.1.2 Marking on access doors. Access doors for fire pump rooms shall be labeled
“Fire Pump Room” or “Fire Pump House” with an approved sign. The lettering shall be in
contrasting color to the background. Letters shall have a minimum height of 2 inches (51
mm) with a minimum stroke of 3/8 inch (10 mm).

902.1.4 3 Lighting. Permanently installed artificial ifumination shall be provided in fire
pump rooms.

902.2 Automatic sprinkler system riser rooms. A dedicated aufomatic sprinkler
system riser room shall be required for each fire sprinkler system riser.

Exceptions:
1. Where approved by the fire code official, where systems are controlled
by wall-mounted Post Indicator Valves (PIV), and where exterior access

is provided to the monitoring panel that is located in a conditioned room,
an automatic sprinkler system riser room is not required.

Page 22 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



2. When approved, where a single system serves the building and the
system is controlled by a PIV, a riser room is not required.

3. In multi-story facilities, floor control risers are permitted to be located on
each floor level in an exit stair enclosure.

4. Systems designed in accordance with NFPA 13D do not require an
automatic sprinkler system riser room.

5. Systems designed in accordance with NFPA 13R shall have an
automatic sprinkler system riser room/closet that is large enough to
facilitate access to all the necessary fire sprinkier and fire alarm valves
and devices. This area shali be accessible from the outside with either a
door or an access panel large enough to allow for testing and
maintenance of system. The area shall also maintain a minimum
temperature of 40° F and a maximum temperature of 100° F.

902.2.1 Contents. The primary automnatic sprinkler system riser room shall contain the
fire riser into the building. The fire riser shall contain at a minimum, a flow switch, a
check valve, and a control valve.

Exception: Where there is a single system in the building and an exterior Post
Indicator Valve (PIV) is provided, then the control vaive is not required in the
automnatic sprinkler system riser room.

902.2.2 Exterior Access Door. Automatic sprinkler system riser rooms shall have an
exterior access door with a minimum width of 36 inches (814 mm) and a minimum height
of 80 inches (2032 mm)

Exception: For high-rise, terminal, and covered mall buildings, secondary fire
risers may be contained in automatic sprinkler system riser rooms that are
located in dedicated rooms as approved by the fire code official in areas without
direct access from the exterior.

902.2.3 Protection. Automatic sprinkler system riser rooms shall be separated from the
rest of the building by 1-hour fire partitions.

902.2.4 Size. The riser room shall have a minimum area of 16 square feet (1.49 m?),
with a minimum dimension of 4 feet, for the first sprinkler tiser, plus an additional 9
square feet for each additional riser contained.

902.2,5 Clearances for a fire alarm control unit. Where a fire alarm control unit is
located in the automatic sprinkier system tiser room, the unit shall be located so that
there is a minimum clearance in accordance with the electrical code.

902.2.6 Auxiliary control valves. Automatic sprinkler system riser rooms are not
required for auxiliary control valves.

902.2.7 Signage. Weatherproof signage shall be provided on the exterior access door.
Signage shail state “Fire Sprinkler Riser Room” in a contrasting color. Letters shall have
a minimum height of 2 inches with a minimum stroke of 3/8 inch.

902.3 Environment. Automatic sprinkler systemn riser rooms and fire pump rooms shall
be maintained at a temperature of not less than 40° F and a maximum temperature of
100° F. Heating and cooling units shall be permanently installed.

Paga 23 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



Exceptions:

1. Where the fire sprinkler riser room or fire pump room does not contain
a Fire Alarm/Monitoring Panel or spare sprinklers heads, or when these
devices are rated for higher ambient temperatures the room shall not be
required to be conditioned for maximum temperature.

2. Heating and/or conditioning is not required if calculations are prepared
and sealed by a design professional, on a case-by case address specific
basis, proving that the temperature within the riser room does not fall or
rise below the temperature range of 40° F to 100° F. To maintain 40° F,
the temperature analysis must use a starting temperature of 50° F and
use an outside temperature of 0° F for a period of 8 hours. To maintain
100° F, the temperature analysis must use a starting temperature of 90° F
and use an outside temperature of 120° F for a period of 8 hours.

3. Where the fire sprinkler riser room or fire pump room contains
equipment that has a higher manufacturer's temperature rating
acceptable to the fire code official.

Section 903.1.1

Delete Section 903.1.1

Section 903.3.1.1.1

Revise Section 903.3.1.1.1 to read as follows:

903.3.1.1.1 Exempt locations, Automatic sprinklers shall not be required in the
following rooms or areas where such rooms or areas are protected with an approved
automatic fire detection system in accordance with Section 907.2 that will respond to
visible or invisible particles of combustion. Sprinklers shall not be omitted from any room
merely because it is damp, or fire-resistance rated construction, or contains electrical
equipment.

1. Any room where the application of water, or flame and water, constitutes a

serious life or fire hazard.

2. Any room or space where sprinklers are considered undesirable because of

the nature of the contents, when approved by the fire code official.

3. Fire service access elevator machine rooms and machinery spaces.

4. Machine rooms, machinery spaces, control rooms and control spaces

associated with occupant evacuation elevators designed in accordance with

Section 3008.

Section 903.3.1.2

Revise Section 903.3.1.2 to read as follows:

903.3.1.2 NFPA 13R sprinkler systems. Aufomatic sprinkler systems in Group R
Occupancies up to and including two stories in height in buildings not exceeding 60 feet
(18 288 mm}in height above grade plane shall be permitted to be installed throughout in
accordance with NFPA 13R.

Page 24 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



The number of stories in Group R occupancies constructed in accordance with Section
510.2 and 510.4 shall be measured from the horizontal assembly creating separate

buildings.

Section 903.2

Revise Section 903.2 to read as follows:

903.2 Where required. Approved aufomatic sprinkler systems in new buildings and
structures shall be provided throughout all buildings and structures, regardiess of occupancy
type and including buildings and structures in accordance with the Infernational Residential
Code, which meet one of the following requirements, and additionally in the locations
described in Sections 903.2.1 through 903.2.12:

1.

For buildings constructed in accordance with the International Building Code,
approved automatic sprinklers systems are required where the building area
exceeds 5,000 square feet (464 m?).

For buildings constructed in accordance with the International Residential
Code, approved automatic sprinkler systems are required where the living
space exceeds 5,000 square feet (464 m?).

For any buildings, not otherwise requiring fire sprinklers, where the available
fire flow does not meet the fire flow requirements of the Infernational Fire
Code, approved aufomatic sprinkler systems shali be provided as required by
the fire code official.

Exceptions:

1.

Open parking garages with no other occupancy above the open parking
garage structure and with fire apparatus lanes immediately adjacent to two
open sides of the garage equaling a minimum of 40% of the garage perimeter
are not required to be protected with automatic sprinklers.

Automatic sprinklers shall not be required in buildings or structures used
exclusively for agricultural, fivestock, or equestrian activities, with or without
spectators, where structures may cover the use, including the spectator area,
provided the use is not enclosed with any walls along any portion of the
perimeter of the structures, except for rooms containing code-required
building service components, and provided that the minimum clear height
along the entire perimeter of the structure is 7 feet 6 inches (2286 mm}.
Buildings, structures, or service equipment and installations directly used in
utility generation or distribution which are installed on properly recorded
easements belonging to water, gas, power, telephone, or other utility
companies that are preemptively regulated by the Nevada Public Service
Committee, a State of Nevada charter, or other public franchise. This
exception does not apply to non-exempted buildings or structures containing
occupiable spaces such as offices, meeting rooms, service counters, public
restrooms, or other normally occupied spaces.

Playground shade structures, fuel dispensing canopies, and carports open to
a minimum clear height of 10 feet on all sides around the entire perimeter,
with non-combustible structural support and frame, with either non-
combustible material, or fabric complying with NFPA 701 providing shade,
located a minimum of 10 feet from the nearest building, property line or shade
structure, and less than 10,000 square feet in projected area, do not reguire
fire sprinklers.

For new construction expanding existing unsprinkiered Group R-3 buildings
or one- and two-family dwellings built in accordance with the International

Page 25 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



Residential Code, sprinklers are not required to be retrofitted into the buiiding
where the building is provided with fire flow in accordance with Appendix B
and the newly added living space does not exceed 5,000 square feet.

If any fire area in a building or structure is provided with fire sprinkiers, whether required
or not, all fire areas in the building or structure shall be provided with fire sprinklers:

Exceptions:

1. Where a building is subdivided into separate buildings, each having a total
building area of less than 5,000 sq ft (464 m?), by fire walls with no openings
constructed in accordance with the International Building Code.

2. Special hazard areas that required sprinklers for certain uses, such as
medical gas rooms, may be fire sprinklered without requiring additional fire
sprinkiers throughout the building, when approved by the fire code official.

Section 903.2.3

Revise Section 903.2.3 to read as follows:

903.2.3 Group E. An aufomatic sprinkler system shall be provided for Group E
occupancies where one of the following conditions exists:
1. Throughout all Group E fire areas greater than 5,000 square feet in area.
2. The Group E fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge
serving such occupancies.
Exception: In buildings where every classroom has not fewer than one exterior exit door
at ground level, an automatic sprinkier system is not required in any area below the lowest
level of exit discharge serving that area
3. The Group E fire area has an occupant load of 300 or more.
4. Daycare facilities where there is occupancy from 12:00 AM - 6:00 AM and care
for 7 or more children.

Section 903.2,.11.5

Revise Section 903.2.11.5 to read as follows:

903.2.11.5 Commercial cooking operations. An aufomatic sprinkler system shall be
installed in a commercial kitchen exhaust hood and duct system where an automatic
sprinkler system is used to comply with Section 904, and for the entire length of duct
when the duct length exceeds 75 fest.

Section 903.4

Revise Section 903.4 to read as follows:

903.4 Sprinkler system supervision and alarms. Valves controlling the water supply
for automatic sprinkler systems, pumps, tanks, water levels and temperatures, critical air
pressures and waterfiow switches on all sprinkler systems shall be electrically
supervised by a /isted fire alarm control unit.
Exceptions:

1. Automatic sprinklers systems protecting one- and two-family dwellings.

2. Limited area sprinkler systems in accordance with Section 903.3.8.

Page 26 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



3. Automatic sprinklers systems installed in accordance with NFPA 13R where a
common supply main is used to supply both domestic water and the automatic
sprinkler system, and a separate shutoff valve for the automatic sprinkler system
is not provided.

4. Jockey pump control valves that are sealed or locked in the open position,

5. Control valves to paint spray booths or dip tanks that are sealed or locked in the
open position,

6. Valves controlling the fuel supply to fire pump engines that are sealed or locked
in the open position.

7. Trim valves to pressure switches in dry, preaction and deluge sprinkler systems
that are sealed or locked in the open position.

Section 903.4.1
Revise Section 803.4.1 to read as follows:

903.4.1 Monitoring. Alarm, supervisory, and trouble signals shall be distinctly different
and shall be automatically transmitted to an approved supervising station or, when
approved by the fire code official, shall sound an audible signal at a constantly attended
location,

Exceptions:

1. Underground key or hub are not required to be monitored.

2. Backflow prevention devices located at the municipal water supply
connection are not required to be monitored when either locked in the open
position, or are located within an underground vault or an approved insufated
enclosure.

Multi-story facilities shall provide zone annunciation on a floor-by-floor basis.
In occupancies provided with a supervised sprinkler system, the following three
distinctly different signals shall be transmitted to an approved supervising station:
1. Water Flow Alarm
2. Supervisory
3. System Troubie

The supervising station shall only retransmit Water Flow Alarm signals to the Fire
Department.

Section 903.4.2

Revise Section 803.4.2 to read as follows:

903.4.2 Audible and Visual Notification appliances. Approved audible and visual
notification appliances shall be connected to each automatic sprinkier system. Such
sprinkler waterflow alarm notification appliances shall be activated by water flow
equivalent to the flow of a single sprinkler of the smallest orifice size installed in the
system. Exterior audible and visual notification appliances shall be provided on the
exterior of the building above the wall-mounted Fire Department Connection. One
interior audible and visual notification appliance shall be provided near the main
entrance or in a normally occupied location. In multiple-tenant facilities, one interior

Page 27 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



audible and visual notification appliance shall be provided near the main entrance orin a
normally occupied location for each tenant space. Where a fire alarm system is
installed, actuation of the automatic sprinkier system shall actuate the building fire alarm
system.

Section 903.4.3

Revise Section 903.4.3 to read as follows:
903.4.3 Floor control valves. Approved supervised indicating control valves shall be
provided at the point of connection to the riser on each floor in muiti-story facilities.

Section 904.2

Revise Section 904.2 to read as follows:
904.2 Where permitted. Automatic fire-extinguishing systems shall be approved by the
fire code official.

Section 905.3

Revise Section 905.3 to read as follows:

905.3 Required installations. Standpipe systems shall be instalied where required by
Sections 905.3.1 through 905.3.8. Standpipe systems are allowed to be combined with
automatic sprinkler systems.

Exception: Standpipe systems are not required in Group R-3 occupancies.
The standpipe design shall be approved by the fire code official. Standpipes in buildings
with fire pumps shall be automatic. Standpipes in buildings not subject to freezing shall
be wet. Standpipes in areas subject to freezing shall be permitted to be manual dry

when equipped with both KNOX locking caps and/or KNOX plugs for fire department
connections (FDC) and hose valves that are acceptable to the fire chief

Section 905.3.1

Revise Section 905.3.1 to read as follows:

905.3.1 Height. Approved Ciass | W standpipe systems shall be installed throughout
buildings where any of the following conditions exist:

1. Four or more stories are above or below grade plane

2. The floor levei of the highest story is located more than 30 feet (9144 mm) above the
lowest level of the fire department vehicle access.

3. The floor level of the lowest story is located more than 30 feet (9144 mm) below the
highest level of the fire department vehicle access.

Page 28 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



In determining the lowest level of fire department vehicle access, it shall not be required to
consider:

1. Recessed loading docks for four vehicles or less, and

2. Conditions where topography makes access from the fire department vehicle to the
building impractical or impossibie.

Section 905.3.3

Revise Section 905.3.3 to read as follows:

905.3.3 Covered and open mall buildings. Covered mall and open buildings shall be
equipped throughout with a standpipe system where required by Section 905.3.1. Mali
buildings not required to be equipped with a standpipe system by Section 905.3.1 shall
be equipped with Class | hose connections connected to the auformatic sprinkler system
sized to deliver water at 250 gallons per minute (946.4 L/min) at the most hydraulically
remote hose connection while concurrently supplying the automatic sprinkler system
demand. The standpipe system shall be designed not to exceed a 50 pounds per
square inch (psi) (345 kPa) residual pressure loss with a flow of 250 gallons per minute
(946.4 Limin) from the fire department connection to the hydraulically most remote hose
connection. Hose connections shall be provided at each of the following locations:

1. Within the mail at the entrance to each exit passageway or corridor.

2, At each floor-level landing within interior exit stairways opening directly on the
mail.

3. At exterior public entrances to the mall of a covered mail buiilding.
4. At public entrances at the perimeter line of an open mall building.

5. At other locations as necessary so that the distance to reach all portions of a
tenant space does not exceed 100 feet (30 480 mm) of hose and 30-foot (9144
mm) of stream from a hose connection. The length of hose shall be measured
along normal walking routes, and the stream shall not be expected to penetrate
walls or windows,

Section 905.3.9

Revise Section 905.3.9 to read as follows:

905.3.9 Building area. When required by the fire code official, buildings in excess of
10,000 square feet (929 m?) in area per level shall be equipped with a Class | standpipe

Page 28 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018




system where any portion of the building’s interior area is more than 200 feet (60,960
mm) measured vertically and horizontally from the nearest point of fire department
apparatus access.

Section 905.4

Revise Section 905.4 lo read as follows:

905.4 Location of Class | standpipe hose connections. Class | standpipe hose
connection shall be provided in all of the following locations:
1. In every required interior exit stairway, a hose connection shall be provided for each
story above and below grade piane. Hose connections shall be located at the main
floor landing unless otherwise approved by the fire code official.

Exception: A single hose connection shall be permitted to be installed in the
open corridor or open breezeway between open stairs that are not greater than
75 feet (22 860 mm) apart.

2. On each side of the wall adjacent to the exit opening of a horizontal exit.

Exception: Where floor areas adjacent to a horizontal exit are reachable from an
interior exit stairway hose connection by a 30-foot (9144 mm) hose stream from a
nozzle attached to 100 feet (30 480 mm) of hose, a hose connection shall not be
required at the horizontal exit.

3. Inevery exit passageway, at the entrance from the exit passageway to other areas of
a building.

Exception: Where floor areas adjacent to an exit passageway are reachable
from an inferior exit stairway hose connection by a 30-foot (9144 mm) hose
stream from a nozzle attached to 100 feet (30 480 mm) of hose, a hose
connection shall not be required at the entrance from the exit passageway to
other areas of the building.

4. In covered mall buildings, adjacent to each exterior public entrance to the mall and
adjacent to each entrance from an exit passageway or exit corridor to the mall. In
open mall buildings, adjacent to each public entrance to the mall at the perimeter line
and adjacent to each entrance from an exif passageway or exit corridor to the mall.

5. Where the roof has a slope less than four units vertical in 12 units horizontal (33.3-
percent slope), a hose connection located to serve the roof or at the highest landing
of an inferior exit stairway with access to the roof provided in accordance with
Section 1011.12.

6. Throughout the entire building so that all portions of each floor level are provided

with hose valve coverage utilizing 100 feet (30 480 mm) of hose and 30-foot (9144
mm) stream from any hose connection located on that floor or intermediate tanding.

Page 30 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



The length of hose shall be measured along normal walking routes, and the stream
shall not be expected to penetrate walls or windows

Section 905.4.1

Revise Section 905.4.1 to read as follows:

905.4.1 Protection. Risers and laterals of Class | standpipe systems not located within
an interior exit stairway or pressurized enclosure shall be protected by a degree of fire
resistance equal to that required for vertical enclosures in the building in which they are
located.

Exception: In buildings constructed of Type | or Type Il construction or in buildings
equipped throughout with an approved automatic sprinkler system, standpipe laterals
and vertical risers that are not located within an interior exit stairway are not required to
be enclosed within fire-resistance-rated construction.

Section 905.9

Revise Section 905.9 to read as follows:
905.9 Valve supervision. Valves controlling water supplies shali be supervised in the
open position so that a change in the normal position of the valve will generate a

supervisory signal at the supervising station required by Section 903.4. Where a fire
alarm system is provided, a signal shall also be transmitted to the control unit.

Exceptions: Valves to underground key or hub do not require supervision.

Section 906
Amend Section 906.2 as follows and delete Section 906.2 — 906.10.

[F] 906.1 General Portable fire extinguishers are regulated by the International Fire
Code.

Remainder of Section 906, including 906.1, 906.2, 906.3, 906.4, 906.5, 906.6, 906.7,
906.8, 906.9 and 906.10 are deleted.

Section 907.1.4

Revise Section 907.1.4 to read as follows:

907.1.4 Signage. A ‘FIRE ALARM CONTROL PANEL" sign shall be provided in
minimum 2" letters with a minimum %" stroke. The color of the letters shall be
contrasting with respect to the background. The sign shall be provided on the door
leading to the fire alarm control panel(s), unless otherwise approved by the fire code
official.

Page 31 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



Section 907.2

Revise Section 907.2 to read as follows:

907.2 Where required-new buildings and structures. An approved fire alarm system
installed in accordance with the provisions of this code and NFPA 72 shall be provided in
new buildings and structures in accordance with Sections 907.2.1 through 907.2.23 and
provide occupant notification in accordance with Section 907.5, unless other
requirements are provided by another section of this code.

In separated mixed-use occupancy buildings the fire alarm/detection system shall be
limited to the fire area that requires the system. In non-separated mixed-use occupancy
buildings containing an occupancy with a fire alarm/detection system the system is
required to be extended throughout the building or fire area.

A fire alarm system shall be Installed throughout ali buildings three or more stories in
height.

Exception: Group R-3 occupancies and single-family dwellings built under the IRC.

Not fewer than one manual fire alarm box shall be provided in an approved location to
initiate a fire alarm signal for fire alarm systems employing automatic fire detectors or
waterflow detection devices. Where other sections of this code allow elimination of fire
alarm boxes to sprinklers, a single fire alarm box shall be installed.

Exceptions: The manual fire alarm box shall not be Instalied for fire alarm systems
dedicated to elevator recall control and supervisory service: and fire sprinkler monitoring
systems.

Section 907.2.7.1

Delete Section 907.2.7.1

Section 907.2.8.2

Revise Section 907.2.8.2 to read as follows:

907.2.8.2 Automatic smoke detection system. An automatic smoke detection system
that activates the occupant notification system in accordance with Section 907.5 shall be
installed throughout all interior corridors serving sleeping units. For the purposes of this
section, interior means a conditioned space.

Exception: An automatic smoke detection system is not required in buildings
that do not have interior corridors serving sleeping units and where each sleeping
unit has a means of egress doors opening directly to an exif or to an exterior exit
access that leads directly to an exit.

Section 907.2.8.3

Revise Section 907.2.8.3

Page 32 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018




907.2.8.3 Smoke alarms and smoke detectors. Single- and multiple-station smoke
alarms or smoke detectors shall be installed in accordance with Section 907.2.10.

907.2.8.3.1 Smoke detectors. Smoke detectors shall operate in accordance with
907.2.10.7.
Section 907.2.8.4

Add section 907.2.8.4 to read as follows:

907.2.8.4 Smoke detection in sleeping areas. Smoke alarms or smoke detectors
provided in sleeping areas within R-1 occupancies that are required to have a fire alarm
system in accordance with this code shall be able of producing the 520 Hz low frequency
audible alarm signal complying with the sleeping area requirements of NFPA 72.

Section 907.2.9.1

Revise Section 907.2.9.1 to read as follows:

907.2,9.1 Manual fire alarm system. A manual fire alarm system that activates the
occupant notification system in accordance with Section 907.5 shall be installed in
Group R-2 occupancies where any of the following conditions apply:

1. Any dwelling unit or sleeping unit is located three or more stories above
the lowest level of exit discharge;
2. Any dwelling unit or sleeping unit is located more than one story below

the highest level of exit discharge of exits serving the dwelling unit or
sfeeping unit; or

3. The building contains 15 or more awelling units or sleeping units.
Exceptions:
1. A fire alarm system is not required in buildings not more than two sfories

in height where all dwelling units or sleeping units and contiguous attic
and crawl spaces are separated from each other and public or common
areas by at least 1-hour fire partitions and each dwelling unit or sleeping
unit has an exit directly to a public way, exit court or yard.

2. Manual fire alarm boxes are not required where the building is equipped
throughout with an automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance
with Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2 and the occupant notification
appliances will automatically activate throughout the notification zones
upon a sprinkler water flow.

2.1 At least one manual fire alarm box is instalied at an approved
location,

3. A fire alarm system is not required in buildings that do not have interior
corridors serving dwelling units and are protected by an approved
automatic sprinkler system instalied in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1
or 903.3.1.2, provided that dwelling units either have a means or egress
door opening directly to an exterior exit access that leads directly to exits
or are served by open-ended corridors designed in accordance with
Section 1027.6, Exception 3.

Page 33 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



Section 907.2.9.1.1

Revise Section 907.2.9.1.1 to read as follows:

907.2.9.1.1 Automatic smoke detection system. When a fire alarm system is required,
an automatic smoke detection system that activates the occupant notification system in
accordance with Section 807.5 shall be installed throughout all interior corridors serving
dwelling units. For the purposes of this section, interior means a conditioned space.

Exception: An automatic smoke detection system is not required in buildings
that do not have interior corridors serving dwelling units and where each dwelling
unit has a means of egress doors opening directly to an exit or to an exterior exit
access that leads directly to an exit.

Section 907.2.9

Revise Section 907.2.9 to read as follows:

907.2.9.2 Smoke alarms and smoke detectors. Single- and multiple-station smoke
alarms_or smoke detectors shall be installed in accordance with Section 907.2.10.

907.2.9.2.1 Smoke detectors. Smoke detectors shall operate in accordance with
907.2.10.7.

907.2.9.3 Smoke detection in sleeping areas. Smoke alarms or smoke detectors
provided in sleeping areas within R-2 occupancies that are required to have a fire alarm
system in accordance with this code shall be able of producing the 520 Hz low frequency
audible alarm signal complying with the sleeping area requirements in NFPA 72.

907.2.9.4 Group R-2 college and university buildings. An automatic smoke detection
system that activates the occupant notification system in accordance with Section 907.5
shall be installed in Group R-2 occupancies Operated by a college or university for
student or staff housing in all of the following locations:

1. Common spaces outside of dwelling units and sleeping units.
2. Laundry rooms, mechanical equipment rooms and storage rooms.
3. Allinterior corridors serving sleeping units or dwelling units.

Exception: An automatic smoke detection system is not required in buiidings
that do not have interior corridors serving sleeping units or dwelling units and
where each sleeping unit or dwelling unit either has a means of egress door
opening directly to an exterior exit access that leads directly to an exif or a
means of egress door opening directly to an exit.

Required smoke alarms in dwelling units and sleeping units in Group R-2 occupancies

operated by a college or university for student or staff housing shall be interconnected
with the fire alarm system in accordance with NFPA 72.

Page 34 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



Section 907.2.12

Revise Section 907.2.12 to read as foliows:

907.2.12 High-rise buildings. High-rise buildings shall be provided with an automatic
smoke detection system in accordance with Section 907.2.12.1, a fire department
communication system in accordance with Section 907.2.12.2 and an emergency
voice/alarm communication system in accordance with Section 907.5.2.2.

Exceptions:
1. Alirport traffic control towers in accordance with Sections 412 and 907.2.21.
2. QOpen parking garages in accordance with Section 406.5

3. Low-hazard special occupancies in accordance with Section 503,1.1

Section 907.2.12.1.3

Add Section 907.2.12.1.3 to read as follows:

907.2.121.3 System smoke detection with sounder bases. In a new structure
classified as a high-rise building with residential occupancies, in lieu of installing stand-
alone smoke alarms, system-type analog addressable smoke detectors with sounder-
bases shall be installed in all locations required by Section 907.2.11. Activation of said
devices shall send a supervisory alarm signal to the building fire alarm control panel.
The smoke detector sounder shall only sound within the individual dwelling unit, suite of
rooms, or similar area and shall not actuate the building fire alarm system, unless
otherwise permitted by the fire code official.

Section 907.2.12.2

Revise Section 907.2.12.2 to read as follows:

907.2.12.2 Fire department communication system. Where a wired communication
system is provided in addition to an emergency responder radio coverage system in
accordance with Section 510 of the /nfernational Fire Code, the wired fire department
communication system shall be designed and installed in accordance with NFPA 72
using warden stations_and shall operate between a fire command center complying with
Section 911, elevators, elevator lobbies, emergency and standby power rooms, fire
pump rooms, areas of refuge and inside interior exit stairways and other locations as
required by the fire code official. The fire department communication device shall be
provided at each floor level within the interior exit stalrway.

Section 907.2.12.3

Revise Section 907.2.12.3

Page 35 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



907.2.12.3 Multi-channel voice evacuation. Voice evacuation systems for high-rise
buildings shall be multi-channel systems.

Section 907.2.24

Add Section 907.2.24

907.2.24 Child-care smoke detectors. System smoke detectors shall be installed
within sleeping areas of day cares.

Exception: Single-station smoke alarms may be permitted in facilities not
otherwise required to be provided with a fire alarm system.

Section 907.5.2.1.1

Revise Section 907.

5.2.1.1 to read as foliows:

907.5.2.1.1 Average sound pressure. The audible alarm notification appliances shall
provide a sound pressure level of 15 decibels (15 dBA) above the average ambient
sound level or 5 dBA above the maximum sound level having a duration of at least 60
seconds, whichever is greater, in every occupiable space within the building. The
minimum sound pressure levels shall be: 80 dBA in mechanical equipment rooms; and
80 dBA in other occupancies. Audible notification appliances shall be installed in each
occupiable space.

Exceptions:
1.

Section 907.5.2.3.1

Revise Section 907.

807.5.2.3.1

Laundry rooms, walk-in closets, storage rooms and walk-in coolers/freezers
equal to or less than 100 square feet (9.29 m?) in floor area.

In lieu of showing an audible notification appliance within a specific
occupiable space on the plans, caiculations may be provided showing that
the alarm signals from the adjacent audible appliances will achieve a
minimum of 80 decibels inside and throughout that space, where doors or
other barriers between the space and the adjacent audibility device(s) are
closed. Sound pressure levels shall be measured during system
acceptance testing to verify the calculated space achieves a minimum of 80
dBA.

In sleeping areas required to be protected with low-frequency alarms, the
80 dBA minimum sound pressure provision is not required where a listed

fire alarm device is not available to simultaneously achieve both the low-
frequency signal and the 80 dBA minimum sound pressure.

5.2.3.1 to read as follows:

Public use areas and common use areas. Visible alarm notification

appliances shall be provided in public use areas and common use areas.

Page 36 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



1. Electrical and mechanical rooms that are not normally occupied or less than
400 square feet,

Janitor closets.

Storage rooms less than 400 square feet.

Exit enclosures .

Individual work areas or offices and private toilets serving individual work
areas or offices.

Individual inmate sleeping areas and patient sleeping rooms.

abhwn

o

Section 907.6.4.1

Revise Section 807.6.4.1 to read as follows:

907.6.4.1 Alarm Annunciator and Fire Alarm Control Unit. Alarm annunciators and fire
alarm control units shall comply with all of the following:
1. If a building has a main entrance/foyer and has more than one story, a read-only remote
annunciator shall be provided inside the building at the main entrance/foyer.
Exceptions:
1. High-rise buildings provided with a fire command center.
2. Alternate location as approved by the fire code official.

2. If a building has a fire riser room with an exterior door, the fire alarm control unit shall be
provided within the fire riser room.

Exceptions:
1. High-rise buildings provided with a fire command center.
2. Alternate location as approved by the fire code official.

3. The location of an operated initiating device shall be displayed by alphanumeric display
at the annunciator.

4. The alphanumeric display shall state the device type, the floor level (if applicable), the
device address and a descriptive location for the operated device(s).

5. The visible annunciation of the location of operated initiating devices shall not be
canceled by the means used to deactivate alarm notification appliances.

Section 907.6.6

Revise Section 907.6.6 to read as follows:

907.6.6 Monitoring. Fire alarm systems required by this chapter or by the International
Fire Code shall be monitored by an approved supervising station in accordance with
NFPA 72 and as approved by the fire code official. Home care facilities that are licensed
by the State of Nevada are also required to be monitored per this section. Proprietary
Supervising Station Systems (also called self-monitoring systems), when allowed by the
fire code official, shall be in accordance with the IFC and NFPA 72.

Exception: Monitoring by a supervising station is not permitted unless
specifically approved by the fire code official for:

1. Single- and multiple station smoke alarms required by Section 907.2.10.
2. Automatic sprinkler systems in one- and two-family dwellings.

Page 37 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



3. Monitoring systems utilizing point-by-point monitoring.

In occupancies provided with a fire alarm system, the following four distinctly
different alarm signals shall be transmitted to an approved supervising station:

1. Water Flow Alarm, if provided with a fire sprinkler system.
2. Fire Alarm.

3. System Trouble.

4

. Supervisory, when applicable.

For new and existing facilities, the supervising station shall only retransmit Water
Flow Alarm signals to the Fire Department.

Exception: The supervising station shall also retransmit fire alarm signals
for government buildings, (all facilities owned, leased and/or operated by
any City, County, State, or Federal government agency) schools
(including daycares, preschools, public and private schools etc.) and
hospitals (including nursing homes, convalescent homes, adult care
facilities, group homes, extended care facilities, etc.).

Section 909.5.3
Amend Section 909.5.3 to read as follows:

909.5.3 Opening protection. Openings in smoke barriers shall be protected by
automatic-closing devices actuated by the required controls for the mechanical smoke
control system. Door openings shall be protected by fire door assemblies complying with
Section 7186.

Exceptions:

Unchanged.
Unchanged.
Unchanged.
Unchanged.
Unchanged.
Unchanged.
Door openings in smoke barriers shall be permitted to be protected by self-
closing fire doors in the following locations:
7.1 Guest rooms.
7.2 Individual dwelling units
7.3 Mechanical rooms.
7.4 Elevator machine rooms.
7.5 Electrical rooms used exclusively for that purpose.
7.6 Doors typically maintained in a closed position as approved by the
Building Official.

N AW

Page 38 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



Section 909.16
Revise Section 909.16 to read as follows and delete 909.16.1 through 909.16.3:

[F] 909.16 Fire-fighter's smoke control panel. The fire-fighter's smoke control panels
are regulated by the Infernational Fire Code.

Remainder of Section 909.16, including 909.16.1, 909.16.2 and 909.16.3 are to be
deleted.

Section 909.17

Revise 909. 17 to read as follows:

909.17 System response time. Smoke-control system activation shall be initiated
immediately after receipt of an appropriate automatic or manual activation command.
Smoke control systems shall activate individual components (such as dampers and fans)
in the sequence necessary to prevent physical damage to the fans, dampers, ducts and
other equipment. For purposes of smoke control, the fire-fighter's smoke control panel
response time shall be the same for automatic or manual smoke control action initiated
from any other building control point. The total response time, including that necessary
for detection, shut-down of operating equipment and smoke control system startup, shall
allow for full operational mode to be achieved before the conditions in the space exceed
the design smoke condition Upon receipt of an alarm condition at the fire alarm control
panel, fans, dampers and automatic doors shall have achieved their proper operating
state and final status shall be indicated at the smoke control panel within 90 seconds.
Verification shall be reported in the required final report.

Section 909.18.8.3

Revise 909.18.8.3 fo read as follows:

909.18.8.3 Reports. A complete report of testing shall be prepared by the approved
agency. The report shall include identification of all devices by manufacturer, nameplate
data, design values, measured values and identification tag or mark. The report shall be
reviewed by the responsible registered design professional and, when satisfied that the
design intent has been achieved, the responsible registered design professional shall
seal, sign and date the report with a statement as follows:

‘I have reviewed this report and by personal knowledge and on-site observation
certify that the applicable smoke control system(s) are in substantial compliance
with the design intent, and to the best of my understanding complies with
requirements of the code.”

909.18.8.3.1 Report filing. A copy of the final report shall be filed with the

responsible code official and an identical copy shall be maintained in an
approved location at the building.

Page 39 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



Section 909.18.10

Add a new Section 909.18.10 to read as follows:

909.18.10 Alternative testing method. When required by the Code Official, theatrical
smoke or other approved tracer gases shall be used during final acceptance testing to
visually verify air movement.

Section 909.20

Revise 909.20 to read as foliows:

909.20 Smokeproof enclosures. Where required by Section 1023.11, a smokeproof
enclosure shall be constructed in accordance with this section. A smokeproof enciosure
shall consist of an interior exit stairway or ramp that is enclosed in accordance with the
applicable provisions of Section 1023 and an open exterior balcony or pressurized stair
and vestibule meeting the requirements of this section. Where access to the roof is
required by the Intemnational Fire Code, such access shall be from the smokeproof
enclosure where a smokeproof enclosure is required.

(909.20.1 through 909.20.3.3 remain w/o modification)
Deiete Sections 909.20.4 through 909.20.4.4 and replace as follows;

909.20.4 Pressurized stair and vestibule alternative. The provisions of Sections
809.20.4.1 through 909.20.4.3 shall apply to smokeproof enclosures using a pressurized
stair and pressurized entrance vestibule.

909.20.4.1 Vestibule doors. The door assembly from the building into the
vestibule shall be a fire door assembiy complying with Section 716.2.2.1. The
door assembly from the vestibule to the sfairway shall not have less than a 20-
minute fire protection rating and meet the requirements for a smoke door
assembly in accordance with Section 716.2.2.1. The door shall be installed in
accordance with NFPA 105.

909.20.4.2 Pressure difference. The stair enclosure shall be pressurized to a
minimum of 0.05 inch of water gage (12.44 Pa) positive pressure relative to the
vestibule with all stairway doors closed under the maximum anticipated stack
pressures. The vestibule with doors closed shall have a minimum of 0.05 inch of
water gage (12.44 Pa) positive pressure relative to the fire floor. The pressure
difference across doors shall not exceed 30 ibs (133-N) maximum force to begin
opening the door.,

909.20.4.3 Dampered relief opening. A controiled relief vent capable of
discharging a minimum of 2,500 cfm (1180 L/s) of air at the design pressure
difference shall be located in the upper portion of the pressurized exit enclosure.

Section 909.20.5.1

Add a new Section 909.20.5.1 to read as follows:

Page 40 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



909.20.5.1 Dampered relief opening. A controlled relief vent capable of discharging a
minimum of 2,500 cfm (1180 L/s) of air at the design pressure difference shall be located
in the upper portion of the pressurized stair enclosure.

Section 9111

Revise Section 911 to read as follows:

911.1 General. Where required by other sections of this code and in buildings classified
as high-rise buildings by this code, a fire command center for fire department operations
shall be provided and shall comply with Sections 911.1.1 through 911.1.6. When
required, a Secondary Response Point shall comply with Section 911.2.

Section 911.1.3

Revise Section 911.1.3 to read as follows:

911.1.3 Slze. The fire command center shall be not less than 0.015 percent of the total
building area of the facility served or 200 square feet (19 m?) in area, whichever is
greater, with a minimum dimension of 0.7 times the square root of the room area or 10
feet (3048 mm), whichever is greater.

Section 911.2

Add Section 911.2 to read as follows

911.2 Secondary Response Point. A Secondary Response Point (SRP) shall comply with
Section 911.2.1 through 911.2.3.

911.2.1 Where required. When required by the fire code official, an SRP shall be
provided in buildings/facilities that are required to be served by a Fire Command Center.

911.2.2 Components required. The SRP shall have the following components:

1. A fire alarm LCD annunciator that provides a means to scroll through the list of
devices that are activated and to acknowledge each alarm. The fire alarm
annunciator shall not have the capability of silencing or resetting the building fire
alarm system.

2. A microphone capable of providing all-call voice messaging over all notification
appliance circuits of the alarm communication system.

3. A pull station capable of evacuating the entire building.

4. An elevator panel that allows the manual transfer of standby power to each
elevator cab for all elevators located within the building.

Exception: Where an elevator panel allowing manual transfer of standby
power for all elevators is provided at the Fire Command Center, an elevator
panel is not required at the SRP.

Page 41 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



911.2.3 Location. The SRP shall be located as foilows, subject to the approval of the
fire code official:

1.
2,

3.

The SRP shall be located on the floor designated for primary elevator recall.

The exterior entrance leading to the SRP shall be adjacent to the fire department
vehicle access lane,

The SRP shall be located in an area inaccessible to the public.

The SRP shall be located within a travel distance of 200 feet from the building
entry.

The entrance to the SRP shall be separated from the Fire Command Center a
minimum distance equal to 25% of the building perimeter, or a minimum of 250
feet, as measured along the building perimeter.

Section 913.1.1

Add subsection 913.1.1 to read as follows:

913.1.1 Redundant pumps in high-rise structures. Where pumps are used in
structures with an occupied floor or occupied roof greater than 250 feet (76 m) in height
above the lowest level of fire department access, a redundant fire pump shall be
provided for each required fire pump.

Section 913.1.2

Add new Subsection 913.1.2 to read as follows:

913.1.2 Redundant pumps in multiple structures. Where a fire pump is used for
booster pressure supply to multiple structures, a redundant fire pump shall be provided
for each required fire pump.

Section 913.2.3

Add Section 913.2.3 to read as follows:

913.2.3 Drains. Floor drains having a minimum diameter of 3 inches shall be provided in
the fire pump room.

Section 1006.2.1

Amend Section 1006.2.1 to read as follows:

TABLE 1006.2.1
SPACES WITH ONE EXIT OR EXIT ACCESS DOORWAY

WITHOUT SPRINKLER SYSTEM WITH
MAX. OCC. (feot) SPRINKLER
OCC. LOAD OF SYSTEM
SPACE
Occupant Load {feet)

Page 42 of 92 Dated: Juiy 3, 2018



s£30 >30

R-1 20 10 NP NP 125* 78°

(All other portions of the Table and all Footnotes remain unchanged)

Section 1010.1.8
Amend Section 1010.1.8 to read as follows:

1010.1.8 Door arrangement. Space between two doors in a series shall be 48 inches
(1219 mm) minimum pius the width of a door swinging into the space. Doors in a series
shall swing either in the same direction or away from the space between the doors.

Exceptions:

1. The minimum distance between horizontal sliding power-operated doors in a
series shall be 48 inches (1219 mm).

2. Storm and screen doors serving individual dwelling units in Groups R-2 and
R-3 need not be spaced 48 inches (1219 mm) from the other door.

3. Doors within individual dwelling units in Groups R-2 and R-3 other than within
Type A dwelling units,

4. The space between doors serving access vestibules of smokeproof
enclosures shall be permitted to be in accordance with Section 909.20.1.

Section 1010.1.9.12
Amend Section 1010.1.9.12 to read as follows:

1010.1.9.12 Stairway doors. interior stairway means of egress doors shall be openable
from both sides without the use of a key or special knowledge or effort.

Exceptions:

1. Unchanged

2. Unchanged

3. Stalrway exit doors are permitted to be locked from the side opposite the
egress side, provided they are openable from the egress side, unlocked
simultaneously without unlatching upon a signal from the fire command
center, if present, or a signal by emergency personnel from a location inside
te the building.
Unchanged
Unchanged
Upon approval of the building official, stairway doors opening directly into
sleeping units, dwelling units or tenant spaces are permitted to be locked
from the side opposite the egress side, provided they are openable from the
egress side. The doors are permitted to unlock without uniatching onily upon
signal from the fire command center, if present, or a signal by emergency
personnel from an approved location inside the building.

o0

Section 1017.2.3

Page 43 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



Add Section 1017.2.3 to read as follows:

1017.2.3 Corridor increases. The travel distances specified in Table 1017.2 may be
increased up to an additional 100 feet (30 480 mm) provided that the last portion of exit
access leading to the exit occurs within a minimum one-hour fire-resistance rated
corridor. The length of such corridor shall not be less than the amount of increase taken,
in feet (mm).

Section 1023.4
Amend Section 1023.4 fo read as follows:

1023.4 Openings. Interior exit stairway and ramp opening protectives shall be in
accordance with the requirements of Section 716.

Openings in interior exit stairways and ramps other than unprotected exterior openings
shall be limited to those necessary for exit access to the enclosure from normally
occupied spaces and for egress from the enclosure.

Elevators shall not open into inferior exit stairways and ramps.

Exception: Interior exit stairways are permitted to be provided a buffer vestibule
between the floor and the interior exit stairway for areas considered normally non-
occupied spaces. The buffer vestibule is required to be constructed in accordance
with Section 909.20.1 and provided with automatic-closing opening protection in
accordance with Section 716. The buffer vestibule is in addition to any vestibules
required by Section 909.20. Smoke detection shall be provided within the buffer
vestibule. Where a building fire alarm system is provided, the buffer vestibule smoke
detector(s) shall be connected to the building fire alarm system.

Section 10245
Amend Section 1024.5 fo read as follows:

1024.5 Openings. Exit passageway opening protectives shall be in accordance with the
requirements of Section 716.

Except as permitted in Section 402.8.7, openings in exit passageways other than
unprotected exterior openings shall be limited to those necessary for exit access to the
exit passageway from normally occupied spaces and for egress from the exit
passageway.

Where the interior exit stairway or ramp is extended to an exit discharge or a pubic way
by and exit passageway, the exif passageway shall comply with Section 1023.3.1.

Elevators shall not open into interior exit passageway.

Exception: Exit passageways are permitted to be provided with a buffer vestibule
between the floor and the exif passageway for areas considered normally non-
occupied spaces. The buffer vestibule is required to be constructed in accordance
with Section 909.20.1 and provided with automatic-closing opening protection in
accordance with Section 716. The buffer vestibule is in addition to any vestibules
required by Section 909.20. Smoke detection shall be provided within the buffer

Page 44 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



vestibule. Where a building fire alarm system is provided, the buffer vestibule smoke
detector(s) shall be connected to the building fire alarm system.

Section 1029.6.2.3
Amend Section 1029.6.2.3 to read as follows:

1029.6.2.3 Automatic sprinklers. Enclosed areas with walls and ceilings in buildings or
structures containing smoke-protected assembly seating shall be protected with an
approved automatic sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1.

Exceptions: Outdoor seating facilities where seating and the means of egress in
the seating area are essentially open to the outside.

Section 1109.16
Add new section1109.186 fo read as follows:

1109.16 General. Where Electric Vehicle Charging Stations are provided, all charging
stations shall be provided in accordance with this section and applicable portions of ICC
A117.1.

1109.16.1 Existing facilities. Where Electric Vehicle Charging Stations are
either added or altered within a facility having existing Electric Vehicle Charging
Stations, the requirements this section shall apply only to the newly installed or
altered Efectric Vehicle Charging Stations.

1109.16.2 Minimum number. Where Electric Vehicle Charging Stations are
provided for public use, the minimum number of accessible Elsciric Vehicle
Charging Stations shall be provided in accordance with Table 1109.16.2. Where
new Electric Vehicle Charging Stations are installed in facilities with existing
Electric Vehicle Charging Stations, the total number provided in Table 1109.16.2
shall include both existing and new Efectric Vehicle Charging Stations. Where an
Electric Vehicle Charging Stafion charger can simultaneously charge more than
one vehicle, the number of Electric Vehicle Charging Station chargers provided
shall be considered equivalent to the number of electric vehicles that can be
simultaneously charged.

Parking spaces serving Electric Vehicle Charging Stations per this section shall
not account for any of the accessible parking spaces (as required by Section
1106) on the site unless specifically provided with accessible identification
signage per Section 1109.16.6.

Exception:

1. Electric Vehicle Charging Stations not available to the general public and
intended for use by a designated vehicle or driver shall not be required to
comply with this section. Examples include, but are not limited to, charging
stations serving public or private fleet vehicles, assigned to an employee, or
serving private residences.

Table 1109.16.2 Electric Vehicle Charging Stations for Public Use

Page 45 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



Number of EV Minimum Number of Adaptable
Charging Stations EV Charging Stations Required
Provided
1to 25 1
26 to 50 2
511075 3
76 to 100 4
Over 101 4, plus 1 for each 300 over 100

1109.16.3 Vehicle space size. Parking spaces serving adaptable Electric
Vehicle Charging Stations shall be sized the same as an accessible parking
space including both the parking space and the accessible aisle serving it.

1109.16.3.1 Van Space. A minimum of one (1) parking space serving an
adaptable Electric Vehicle Charging Station shall be sized the same as a
van-accessible parking space including both the parking space and the
accessible aisle serving it.

1109.16.4 Operable Parts and Related Equipment. Pay terminals, operable
parts, graphic displays and other related features shall be accessible.,

1109.16.5 Accessible routes. Accessible routes shall be provided to serve
Electric Vehicle Charging Stations in accordance with Sections 1109.16.5.1 and
1109.16.5.2.

1109.16.5.1 Building or facility. Adaptable Electric Vehicle Charging
Stations that serve a building or facility on the same site shall be located
along an accessible route providing access to an accessible building
entrance. Where Adaptable Electric Vehicle Charging Stations do not
serve a building or facility on the same site, they shall be located along an
accessible route providing access to the public way.

1109.16.5.2 Charging stations. Adaptable FElsctric Vehicle Charging
Stations shall be provided with an accessible route between the
accessible aisle serving it and all related operable parts and other
equipment. When a vehicle is being charged, the accessible route shall
not be obstructed by the cable between the vehicle and the charging
station.

1109.16.6 Accessible identification signs. Adaptable Electric Vehicle Charging
Stations shall be identified by the International Symbol of Accessibility.

Exception:
1. Where a total of ten or fewer Electric Vehicle Charging Stations are
provided, accessible identification signage is not required.
Section 1210
Add Section 1210 to read as follows:

SECTION 1210
BABY CHANGING TABLES

Page 46 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



1210.1 General. Where newly constructed buildings or facilities contain restrooms that are
provided for public use, a minimum of one (1) baby changing table shall be provided to
comply with all of the following:

1. Located within a public restroom or other area as approved by the Building Official.
2. Continuously available to both male and female occupants.
3. Applicable provisions of ICC A117.1.

Exception: Baby changing tables are not required in facilities that have been issued a
permit or license which restricts the admission of children on the basis of age.

Section 1406
Revise Section 1406 fo read as follows:
METAL COMPOSITE MATERIALS (MCM)

1406.1 General. The provisions of this section shall govern the materials, construction
and quality of metal composite materials (MCM) for use as exterior wall coverings in
addition to other applicable requirements of Chapters 14 and 16.

1406.2 Foam plastic insulation. MCM systems containing foam plastic insulation shall
also comply with the requirements of Section 2603.

1406.3 Labeling. MCM shall be labeled in accordance with Section 1703.5.

1406.4 Exterior wall finish. MCM used as exterior wall finish or as elements of
balconies and similar projections and bay and oriel windows to provide cladding or
weather resistance shall comply with Sections 1406.6 through 1406.14.

1406.5 Architectural trim and embellishments. MCM used as architectural trim or
embellishments shall comply with Sections 1406.9 through1406.14.

1406.6 Structural design. MCM systems shall be designed and constructed to resist
wind oads as required by Chapter 16 for components and cladding.

1406.7 Approval. Results of approved tests or an engineering analysis shall be
submitted to the building official to verify compliance with the requirements of Chapter 16
for wind loads.

1406.8 Weather resistance. MCM systems shall comply with Section 1402 and shall be

designed and constructed to resist wind and rain in accordance with this section and the
manufacturer's installation instructions.

Page 47 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



1406.9 Durability. MCM systems shall be constructed of approved materials that
maintain the performance characteristics required in Section 1406 for the duration of
use.

1406.10 Fire-resistance rating. Where MCM systems are used on exterior walls
required to have a fire-resistance rating in accordance with Section 704, evidence shall
be submitted to the building official that the required fire-resistance rating is maintained.

Exception: MCM systems not containing foam plastic insulation, which are
installed on the outer surface of a fire-resistance-rated exterior wall in a manner
such that the attachments do not penetrate through the entire exterior wall
assembly, shall not be required to comply with this section.

1406.11 Surface-burning characteristics. Unless otherwise specified shall have a
flame spread index of 75 or less and a smoke-developed index of 450 or less when
tested in the maximum thickness intended for use in accordance with ASTM E 84 or UL
723.

1406.12 Type V construction. MCM shall be permitted to be installed on buildings of
Type V construction not exceeding 40 feet in height.

Exception: MCM on exterior walls of Type V Buildings are exempt from the
height restrictions when meeting the requirements of 1406.13.4.

1406.13 Type L, Il Il and IV construction. Where installed on buildings of Type |, II, 1l
and IV construction, MCM systems shall comply with Sections 1406.13.1 through
1406.13.4, or Section 1406.14.

1406.13.1 Surface-burning characteristics. Metal composite materials shall
have a flame spread index of not more than 25 and a smoke-developed index of
not more than 450 when tested in the maximum thickness intended for use in
accordance with ASTM E 84 or UL 723.

1406.13.2 Thermal barriers. MCM shall be separated from the interior of a
building by an approved thermal barrier consisting of ¥ -inch (12.7 mm) gypsum
wallboard or a material that is tested in accordance with and meets the
acceptance criteria of both the Temperature Transmission Fire Test and the
Integrity Fire Test of NFPA 275.

1406.13.3 Thermal barrier not required. The thermal barrier specified for MCM
in Section 1406,13.2 is not required where:

1. The MCM system is specifically approved based on tests conducted in
accordance with NFPA 286 and with the acceptance criteria of Section
803.1.1.1, UL 1040 or UL 1715. Such testing shall be performed with the
MCM in the maximum thickness intended for use. The MCM system shall
include seams, joints and other typical details used in the installation and
shall be tested in the manner intended for use.

2. The MCM is used as elements of balconies and similar projections,
architectural frim or embellishments.

1406.13.4 Full-scale tests, The MCM system shall be tested in accordance with,
and comply with, the acceptance criteria of NFPA 285, Such testing shall be
performed on the MCM system with the MCM in the maximum thickness
intended for use.

Page 48 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



1406.14 Alternate conditions. MCM and MCM systems shall not be required to comply
with Section-1406.13.4 provided such systems comply with Section 1406.14.1

1406.14.1 Installations up to 40 feet in height. MCM shal! not be installed
more than 40 feet (12 190 mm) in height above grade where installed in
accordance with Sections 1406.14.1.1 through 1406.14.1.4

1406.14.1.1 Self-ignition temperature. MCM shall have a self-ignition
temperature of 650°F (343°C) or greater when tested in accordance with
ASTM D 1929.

1406.14.1.2 Combustibility Classification. MCM shall qualify as a Class
CC1 material with a burning extent of 1 inch (25 mm) or less when tested

at a nominal thickness of 0.060 inch (1.5 mm) or in the thickness intended
for use in accordance with ASTM D 635.

1406.14.1.3 Fire separation distance of 5 feet or less. Where the fire
separation distance is 5 feet (1524 mm) or less, the area of MCM shall
not exceed 10 percent of the exterior wall surface.

1406.14.1.4 Fire separation distance greater than 5 feet. Where the
fire separation distance is greater than 5 feet (1524 mm), the area of
exterior wall surface coverage using MCM shall not be limited.

(Options 1 and 2 in Sections 1406.11.3 and 1406.11.4 are deleted in total.)

Table 1607.1

Revise Table 1607.1 and add footnote p, to read as follows:

(Remainder of Table and footnotes remain unchanged)

UNIFORM CONCENTRATED
OCCUPANCY OR USE (psh) (Ibs)
25 Residential
One- and two- family dwellings
Uninhabitable attics without storage 10
Uninhabitable attics with storage "**? 20
Habitable attics and sleeping areas * 40 —
All other areas 40
Hotels and multiple-family dwellings
Private rooms and corridors serving them 40
Public rooms ™ and corridors serving them 100

* Attics, designed per uniform loads described for uninhabitable attics, are not required
to be designed for the additional concentrated load of ltem 28

Section 1609.1.1

Add a new exception #7 to Subsection 1609.1.1, to read as follows:
Exceptions:
(Exception 1 -6 remain unchanged)

Page 48 of 92 Dated: Juiy 3, 2018



7. Solid and freestanding walls up to and including 10°-0" above the highest adjacent
grade and designed using the provisions of ASCE 7 section 29.3.1 need only consider
CASE A of Figure 29.3-1 with a C; factor equal to 1.40 and the resultant applied at the
geometric center of the wall.

Section 1610

Revise Section 1610 to read as follows:

1610.1 General. Foundation walls and retaining walls shall be designed to resist lateral
soil loads. When a geotechnical investigation report is not required by the building official
the design active pressure shall be 45 psf/ft and the at-rest pressure shall be 60 psfift.
Foundation walls and other walls in which horizontal movement is restricted at the top
shall be designed for at-rest pressure, unless specified otherwise in a geotechnical
investigation report approved by the building official. Retaining walls free to move and
rotate at the top shall be permitted to be designed for active pressure. Design lateral
pressure from surcharge loads shall be added to the lateral earth pressure load. Design
lateral pressure shall be increased if soils at the site are expansive. Foundation walls
shall be designed to support the weight of the full hydrostatic pressure of undrained
backfill unless a drainage system is installed in accordance with Sections 1805.4,2 and
1805.4.3.

Exception: Foundation walls extending not more than 8 feet (2438 mm) below
grade and laterally supported at the top by flexible diaphragms shall be permitted
to be designed for active pressure.

1610.1.1 Seismic load due to lateral earth pressure. All basement, foundation,
and retaining walls shall be designed to resist the seismic load due to the lateral
earth pressure based on the following equations, as required by section
1807.2.2.

For yielding walls: 3/8 (ky) (backfill soil unit weight) (H>  (Equation 16-35a)
For nonyielding walls: (ku) (bacifill soil unit weight) (H*  (Equation 16-35b)

Where ky (peak ground acceleration) = Spg / 2.5
H = the height of the backfill behind the wall

These equations represent the dynamic (seismic) lateral thrust. The point of
application of the resultant dynamic thrust is taken at a height of 0.6H above the
base of the wall. This is represented as an inverted trapezoidal pressure
distribution. These equations apply to level backfill and walls that retain no more
than 15 feet.

Section 1612.2.2
Revise Section 1612.2.2, to read as follows:

1613.2.2 Site class definitions. Based on the site soil properties, the site shall be
classified as Sife Class A, B, C, D, E, or F in accordance with Chapter 20 of ASCE 7.

Where the soil properties are not known in sufficient detail to determine the site class,
Site Class D, subjected to the requirements of Section 1613.2.3, shall be used unless
the building official or geotechnical data determines Site Class E or F soils are present at
the site,

Page 50 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



Where site investigations that are performed in accordance with Chapter 20 of ASCE 7
reveal rock conditions consistent with Site Class B, but site-specific velocity
measurements are not made, the site coefficients F, and F, shall be taken at unity (1.0).

ASCE 7 states that Site Classes A and B, shall not be assigned to a site if there is more
than 10 feet (3.1 m) of soil between the rock surface and the bottom of the spread
footing or mat foundation. This provision shall be required when the average soil shear
wave veiocity, v, within 10 feet of the foundation bottoms is less than 2,500 fps.

When site class is determined in accordance with Chapter 20 ASCE 7, the frequency of
evaluation shall be one per 40 acres or any portion thereof. A site class exploration
within 1,000 feet of the proposed site may be included in the total number of required
explorations, but at least one exploration must be located within the site boundaries.
Locations of site class explorations shall be determined by the registered design
professional, but should be adequately spaced to classify the entire site. Additional site
class explorations may be required by the building official if soil conditions are variable
across the site. Where methods other than soil shear wave velocity testing are utilized,
one test, N; or s, must be performed at ten foot intervals for the entire 100-foot
exploration. Each distinctly different soil layer must also be tested. The same test used
for a distinct soil iayer may also be used for the ten foot interval provided the test interval
does not exceed ten feet.

Where the site-specific site response analyses are required to obtain site ground

motions in accordance with the ASCE/SEl 7-16 Section 11.4.7 and Chapter 21, the Site

Class may be alternately determined from the Clark County Shear Wave Velocity Profile

Map or the City of Henderson Seismic Site Class Map as follows: for projects that are

exempt from the requirement for a Geotechnical Investigation per Section 1803.2 the

Site Class can be determined directly from the referenced maps; for projects that are

required to provide a Geotechnical Investigation per Section 1803.2, the Geotechnicai

Design Professional may determine site class directly from the referenced maps subject

to the following limitations:

1. The potential for site class E or F shali be evaluated and documented in the
Geotechnical Investigation Report.

2. Mapped values shall not be used where there will be more than 10 feet of fill below
the bottom of foundations.

3. Mapped values shall not be used where a Site-Specific Ground Motion Analysis is
performed in accordance with ASCE-7 Chapter 21.

4. Mapped values shall not be used for high rise structures or for Risk Category IV
structures,

Section 1612.3

Revise Section 1612.3 fo read as follows:

1612.3 Establishment of flood hazard areas. To establish flood hazard areas, the
applicable governing authority shall adopt a flood hazard map and supporting data. The
flood hazard map shall include, at a minimum, areas of special flood hazard as identified
by the Federal Emergency Management Agency in an engineering report entitled “The
Flood Insurance Study for Clark County, Nevada and Incorporated Areas,” most current
edition, as amended or revised with the accompanying Fiood Insurance Rate Map
(FIRM) and Flood Boundary and Floodway Map (FBFM) and related supporting data
along with any revisions thereto. The adopted flood hazard map and supporting data are
hereby adopted by reference and declared to be part of this section.

Pags 51 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



Section 1613.1
Delete Exception #1 to Section 1613.1, to read as follows:

1613.1. Scope. Every structure, and portion thereof, including nonstructural
components that are permanently attached to structures and their supports and
attachments, shall be designed and constructed to resist the effects of earthquake
motions in accordance with ASCE 7, excluding Chapter 14 and Appendix 11A. The
seismic design category for a structure is permitted to be determined in accordance with
Section 1613 or ASCE 7.

Exceptions:

1. The seismic force-resisting system of wood-frame buildings that conform to the
provisions of Section 2308 are not required to be analyzed as specified in this
section.

2. Agricultural storage structures intended only for incidental human occupancy.

3. Structures that require special consideration of their response characteristics and

environment that are not addressed by this code or ASCE 7 and for which other
regulations provide seismic criteria, such as vehicular bridges, electrical
transmission towers, hydraulic structures, buried utility lines and their
appurtenances and nuclear reactors.

4, References within ASCE 7 to Chapter 14 shall not apply, except as specifically
required herein.

Section 1704.2
Revise Exception #2 to read as follows:
Exceptions:
1. (unchanged)

2. Unless otherwise required by the building official, special inspections are not required for
detached 1 & 2 family dwellings and their Group U accessory structures, including, but
not limited to, those listed in Section 312.1”

Section 1704.2.4

Revise Section 1704.2.4 to read as follows:

1704.2.4 Report requirement. Approved agencies shall keep records of required
special inspections and tests. The approved agency shall submit reports of special
inspections and tests to the building official and to the registered design professional in
responsible charge. Reports shall indicate that work inspected or tested was or was not
completed in conformance to approved construction documents. Discrepancies shall be
brought to the immediate attention of the contractor for correction. If they are not
corrected, the discrepancies shall be brought to the attention of the building official and
to the registered design professional in responsible charge in writing prior to the
completion of that phase of the work. A final report documenting required special

Page 52 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



inspections and tests, and correction of any discrepancies noted in the inspections or
tests shall be submitted to the building official prior to the final inspection.

Section 1705.3

Revise Section 1705.3 to read as follows:

1705.3 Concrete construction. Special inspections and tests of concrete construction
shall be performed in accordance with this section and Table 1705.3.

Exception: Special inspections and tests shall not be required for: ,
1, Isolated spread and/or continuous concrete footings supporting walls
of buildings three stories or less above grade plane that are fully
supported on earth or rock where:
A The footings are designed in accordance with Table 1809.7; or
2 The structural design of the footing is based on a specified
compressive strength ,f ‘c, no more than 2,500 pounds per
square inch (psi) (17.2 MPa), regardless of the compressive
strength specified in the approved construction documents or
used in the footing construction.

1
1

2 Nonstructural concrete slabs supported directly on the ground,
including prestressed slabs on grade, where the effective
prestress in the concrete is less than 150 pounds per square inch
(1.03 MPa).

3. Concrete patios, driveways and sidewalks, on grade.

Section 1705.4

Revise Section 1705.4 to read as follows:

1705.4 Masonry construction. Special inspections and tests of masonry construction
shall be performed in accordance with the quality assurance program requirements of
TMS 402 and TMS 602.

Exceptlon: Special inspections and tests shall not be required for:

1. Empirically designed masonry, glass unit masonry or masonry veneer designed by
Section 2109, 2110, or Chapter 14, respectively, when they are part of structures
classified as Risk Category |, Il, or Il

2. Masonry foundation walls constructed in accordance with Table 1807.1.6.3(1),
1807.1.6.3(2), 1807.1.6.3(3) or 1807.1.6.3(4).

3. Masonry fireplaces, masonry heaters or masonry chimneys installed or constructed
in accordance with Section 2111, 2112, or 2113, respectively.

4. Masonry fences less than or equal to 8-0" in height, retaining walls less than or
equal to 6-0" in height or a combined masonry fence and retaining wall less than or
equal to 14’0" in overall height and the fence portion less than or equal to 8-0” in
height provided that the walls are designed in accordance with Chapter 2 of TMS
402-16 with allowable stresses for masonry reduced by one-half and fm does not
exceed 1500 psi. Wall heights shall be measured from the top of footing to the top of
wall.

Section 1705.5

Page 53 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



Revise the Exception in Section 1705.5 to read as follows:

Exception: Where Section 1803 does not require reporting of materials and procedures
for fill placement, the in-place dry density of the compacted fill shall not be less than 90%
of the maximum dry density at optimum moisture content determined in accordance with

ASTM D 1557,

Table 1705.6

Revise Table 1705.6 to read as follows:

Table 1705.6
REQUIRED SPECIAL INSPECTIONS AND TESTS OF SOILS
TYPE CONTINUOUS PERIODIC
SPECIAL SPECIAL
INSPECTION INSPECTION

1. Verify materials below shallow foundations
are adequate to achieve the design bearing _ X
capacity.
2. Verify excavations are extended to proper X
depth and have reached proper material. —
3. Perform classification and testing of X
compacted fill materials. —
4. Verify use of proper materials, densities and
lift thicknesses during placement and X
compaction of compacted fill and other grading —
activities requiring special inspection.

a. All soils not meeting the requirements of X
category b. —

b. Moderately, highly or critically expansive
soils, hydrocollapsible soils, soluble soils, and/or
soils requiring chemical or mechanical
(geosynthetics) stabilization are encountered.
Construction or stabilization of cut or fill slopes X _
exceeding 5 feet in height, or any site requiring
that fill be placed on a natural slope, an existing
cut slope, or an existing fill slope steeper than
5:1.
5. Prior to placement of compacted fill, observe X

Page 54 of 92

Dated: July 3, 2018



subgrade and verify that site has been prepared
properly.

Section 1705.6.1

Add new Section 1705.6.1 to read as follows:

1705.6.1 Soil Backfill Testing. Special inspection of wall backfill shall be required for all
basement and foundation walls directly supporting structures; this shall apply to the full
depth of backfilled soil. Special inspection of wall backfill shall be required for site
retaining walls when the retained soil height exceeds 6 feet or for portions of walls that
receive surcharge loads from adjacent walls or other structures regardless of retained
soil height.

Section 1705.16

Revise Section 1705.16 to read as follows:

1705.16 Exterior insulation and finish systems (EIFS). Special inspections shall be
required for all EIFS applications.

Exception:

Special inspections shall not be required for EIFS applications installed over
masonry or concrete walls.

Section 1705.19

Revise Section 1705.16 fo read as follows:
1705.19 Amusement and transportation systems special cases. When testing or
verification is required by the manufacturer or specified by the building official, the

testing and verification shall occur during the initial installation, operational testing and
annual renewal of the certificate of operation.

Section 1803.2

Revise Section 1803.2 fo read as follows:

1803.2 Investigations required. Geotechnical investigations shall be conducted in
accordance with Sections 1803.3 through 1803.5.

Page 55 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



Geotechnical investigations shall be prepared by a registered design professional.
Recommendations included in the report and approved by the building official shall be
incorporated in the construction documents. Geotechnical investigations shall be
required for all projects that require new foundations.

Exception: At the option of the building official, the following projects may be exempted
from having a geotechnical investigation.

1. Single story structures, additions, or remodels with a footprint less than 600
square feet,

Fences.

Site retaining walls less than or equal to 6 feet in retained height.

Mobile homes, trailers, and State of Nevada approved single story modular
buildings that are classified as One-Family Dwellings (Residential Group R-3
occupancy).

Modular Buiidings that do not have concrete or masonry foundations.

Carports.

Signs, light poles, and communication towers less than 40 feet in height.

Decks, shade structures, and patio covers accessory to a one or two family
dwelling.

enN

oNo O

Ali projects exempt from a geotechnical report shall assume a maximum presumptive
load bearing value of 1,000 psf for the vertical foundation pressure, 100 psfift for the
lateral bearing pressure, 0.25 for the coefficient of friction for lateral sliding resistance,
and an Exposure Class S2 (severe sulfate exposure level). These specified values for
vertical foundation pressure and lateral bearing pressure may be increased by one-third
where used with the alternate basic load combinations of Section 1605.3.2 that include
wind or earthquake loads.

Section 1803.3.2

Revise Secfion 1803.3.2 to read as follows:

1803.3.2 Minimum Exploration Requirements. The minimum exploration
requirements are as follows:

The minimum depth of an exploration shall be fifteen feet. Exploration depth shall be
increased as necessary to evaluate the suitability of the material within the foundation's
depth of influence as determined by the registered design professional. The
explorations can be terminated should refusal be encountered. However, at least three-
fourths of the required explorations shall be to the minimum depth. The geotechnical
report shall clearly state the refusal criteria. When information regarding the proposed
structure and the final grades is made available, the registered design professional shall
determine if the explorations originally documented In the geotechnical report meet the
depth requirements.

The minimum number of explorations performed shall be as follows:

1. For areas less than or equal to one acre, a minimum of two explorations.

2. For areas greater than one acre, but less than five acres, a minimum of one
exploration for the first acre and one for each additional two acres, or portion thereof.

3. For areas greater than five acres, but less than twenty acres, a minimum of three
explorations plus one additional exploration for each three acres or fraction thereof
above five.

Page 56 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



4,

For areas greater than twenty acres, a minimum of eight explorations plus one
additional exploration for each five acres or fraction thereof above twenty.

Exceptions:

1. A minimum of one exploration is required for single story structures with a
footprint less than 2000 square feet whose locations are known and only that
area of the site is to be developed. This provision is limited to detached
structures classified as Group U occupancy or building additions of any
occupancy. The exploration shall be performed within the proposed footprint.

2. A minimum of one exploration is required for signs, light poles and
communication towers whose locations are known and only that area of the site
is to be developed. The exploration shall be performed within 50 feet of the
proposed foundation for the structure.

Section 1803.5.3

Revise Section 1803.5.3 to read as follows:

1803.5.3 Expansive soil. In areas likely to have expansive soil, the building official
shall require soil tests to determine where such soils do exist.

Soils meeting all provisions of 1 through 4 shall be considered expansive, except that
tests to show compliance with Items 1, 2, and 3 shall not be required if the test
prescribed in Item 4 or 5 is conducted. For all soils detemmined to be expansive by items
1 through 4, item 5 shall also be required to determine the expansion classification level.

ok W Na

Plasticity index (Pl) of 15 or greater, determined in accordance with ASTM D 4318.
More than 10 percent of the soil particles pass a No. 200 sieve (75 ym), determined
in accordance with ASTM D 422.

More than 10 percent of the soil particles are less than 5 micrometers in size,
determined in accordance with ASTM D 422.

Expansion index greater than 20, determined in accordance with ASTM D 4829.
Soils may be determined to be expansive or non-expansive by the preceding
methods or the standard 60 psf swell test.

1803.5.3.1 Expansion classification level. Expansive soils shall be classified in
accordance with amended Table 1808.6.1.1. When soils are determined to be
expansive special design consideration are required. In the event that expansive soil
properties vary with depth the variation shall be included in the engineering analysis
of the expansive soil's effect on the structure. The foundation design and special
inspection for grading/foundations shall be based upon resuits obtained from the
standard 60 pound swell test. Refer to Section 1808.6 for additional requirements.

1803.5.3.2 Standard 60 pound swell test. The swell test samples shall be
remolded to the in-place density required for the particular soil type as called for in
the geotechnical investigation. The test samples shall be one inch thick and laterally
confined by placing them in a consolidometer retaining ring constructed in
accordance with ASTM D 2435. The swell test sample shall be oven dried at 60° C,
and the sample shall be dried a minimum of eight (8) hours, The test samples shall
be inundated with water and kept in a saturated moisture condition until measurable
swelling or vertical movement ceases. The swell test shall use a 60 pounds per
square foot surcharge load. The balance of the swell test will be per ASTM D 2435,
Swell test results shall be interpreted using Table 1808.6.1.1.

Page 57 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



Section 1803.5.8

Add iterns #8 and#9 fo Section 1803.5.8 to read as follows:

(ltems 1-7 remain unchanged.)

8.

9.

Flooding or jetting shall not be used to compact fill material that wili support footings
or foundation systems.

Placement procedure for oversized fill material. No rock or similar irreducible
material with a maximum dimension greater than 12 inches shall be buried or placed
in fills within five feet, measured vertically, from the bottom of the footing or lowest
finished floor elevation, whichever is lower, within the building pad. Oversized fill
material shali be placed so as to assure the filing of all voids with well-graded soil.
Specific placement and inspection criteria shall be stated in the geotechnical
investigation. Continuous special inspection will be required during placement of any
oversized fill material.

Section 1803.6

Revise Section 1803.6 to read as foliows:

1803.6 Reporting. Where geotechnical investigations are required, a written report of
the investigation shall be submitted to the building official by the permit applicant at the
time of permit application. The geotechnical report shall include, but need not be limited
to, the following information:

1.

okwn

A plot showing the location of the test borings, excavations, and/or investigations.
The plot shall be dimensioned and shall show the approximate location of all existing
and proposed structures.

A complete record of the soil boring and penetration test logs and soil samples.

A record of the soil profile.

Depth to the water table, if encountered.

Soil classification by the Unified Soil Classification System (ASTM D 2487). As an
alternative, classification may be performed on a visual-manual basis (ASTM D
2488) in the field by an individual with: a degree in civil engineering, engineering
geology, geologic engineering, or geology; or a Civil or Geological Engineer licensed
in the State of Nevada.

Backup data shall be included for at least one sample for every two (2) excavations
and/or borings distributed among the prominent horizons in the soil profile. The
backup data shall include a particle size distribution analysis, Atterberg limits and
chemical tests for soil sulfates and soil chlorides.

Anticipated structural loads and type of proposed structure.

Provide grading requirements for onsite and import soils (where applicable). Design
recommendations for foundations, grading and earth retaining structures shall
specifically address the suitabiiity of onsite soils for use as fill material and the
potential negative impacts of the following adverse soil conditions including, but not
limited to: coliapsible soils, expansive soils (sweli), soluble soils, corrosive solls
{including sulfates and chlorides), chemical heave, and uncontrolled fill. The report

Page 58 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



10.
11

12.

13.

14.

15.
16.

17.
18.

19.

20.

21
22.

23.

24,
25.
26.

27,

28.

shall include supporting test data and where any of these conditions are identified
on-site, mitigating measures shall be provided based upon the identified conditions.
The requirements for imported fill shall specifically address all of the above adverse
conditions as well.

Anticipated approximate cut and fill depths.

Compacted fill material properties and testing in accordance with Section 1803.5.8.

. Controlled low-strength material properties and testing in accordance with Section

1803.5.9.

Caliche and cemented soils considerations, if encountered. Recommendations for
the removal of caliche and cemented soils and/or the preparation and grading for
foundations on caliche and cemented soils.

Recommendations for foundation type and design criteria, including but not limited
to: bearing capacity of natural or compacted soil; provisions to mitigate the effects of
expansive soils; mitigation of the effects of liquefaction, differential settlement, and
varying soil strength; and the effects of adjacent loads.

Where expansive soils are identified, classify the expansion level of the soil and
specify the minimum embedment depth per Table 1808.6.1.1. When a post-
tensioned slab-on-ground is recommended the geotechnical report must specify the
all soil parameters as required by Section 1808.6.2.

Special design and construction provisions for foundations of structures founded on
expansive soils, as necessary.

Expected total and differential seftlement. Provide all test data and supporting
calculations when the allowable foundation bearing pressure exceeds 4,000 psf.
Deep foundation information in accordance with Section 1803.5.5.

All lateral earth pressures and seismic forces shall be reported in psffft and
distributions expressed in graphical form. All resulting forces must have a
recommendation on wall placement location. Call out the mapped spectral response
accelerations, Ss and Sy, and spectral response coefficients, Sps and Spq assumed
to calculate the distribution.

Site class per Section 1613.2.2, including all test data and supporting calculations.
Specify the soils category, and the level of special inspection required per Table
1705.6. The specified level of special inspection cannot be less than that required by
Table 1705.6.

. Procedures for mitigation for geological hazards.

Trenching or other special procedures for determining fauit and fissure(s) locations.
The potential for differential movement across a fauit and fissuring should be
evaluated.

Where required by 1803.5.11, investigation of liquefaction hazards shall be
performed in accordance with Appendix O “Guidelines for Evaluating Liquefaction
Hazards in Nevada;” investigation of hazards associated with surface displacement
due to faulting or seismically induced lateral spreading or lateral flow shall be
performed in accordance with Appendix P “Guidelines for Evaluating Potential
Surface Fault Rupture/Land Subsidence Hazards in Nevada.”

Erosion control requirements, as applicable.

Geotechnical design considerations for drainage structures, as applicable.

Address, if applicable, the possible impacts on adjoining properties and mitigating
measures to be undertaken.

At the option of the building official, a statement that the grading plans and
foundation plans have been reviewed and are consistent with the stated
geotechnical design criteria.

All geotechnical reports must be current within the last 12 months. Any report older
than 12 months must be accompanied by a wet sealed update letter addressing the
current scope of work and the current site conditions based on a recent site visit. Al
updates to a geotechnical report must include the following three statements:

Page 59 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



a. The update letter must state that the site has been visited and the
geotechnical report has been reviewed.

b. The update letter must state that the new geotechnical engineer of record (if
applicable) is in agreement with all of the recommendations in the
geotechnical report, with any revisions to the recommendations clearly noted.

c. The update letter must state that the engineer sealing the update letter is now
the geotechnical engineer of record for the project.

29. At the option of the building official, a completed copy of a geotechnical report
checklist shall be included with every submittal,

Section 1804.4

Revise Section 1804.4 to read as follows:

1804.4 Site Grading. The ground immediately adjacent to the foundation shall be
sloped away from the building at a slope of not less than one unit vertical in 20 units
horizontal (5-percent slope) for a minimum distance of 10 feet (3048 mm) measured
perpendicular to the face of the wall. If physical obstructions or lot lines prohibit 10 feet
(3048mm) of horizontal distance, a 5-percent slope shall be provided to an approved
alternative method of diverting water away from the foundation. Swales used for this
purpose shall be sloped a minimum of 1 percent along the flow line where located within
10 feet (3048mm) of the building foundation. Impervious surfaces within 10 feet
(3048mm) of the building foundation shall be sloped a minimum of 2 percent away from
the building.

Exceptions:

1. Where low expansive, low collapsible, low soluble soil conditions occur or
where an exterior asphalt or concrete surface abuts a building, the slope of
the ground away from the building foundation is permitted to be reduced to
not less than one unit vertical in 48 units horizontal (2-percent siope).

2. Impervious surfaces shall be permitted to be sloped less than 2 percent
where the surface is a door landing or ramp that is required to comply with
Section 1010.1.5, 1012.3 or 1012.6.1.

The procedure used to establish the final ground level adjacent to the foundation shall

account for additional settlement of the backfill.

Section 1804.4.1

Add new Section 1804.4.1 to read as follows:
1804.4.1 Low collapsible and low soluble soil. Soils, after grading, shall be classified
as low collapsible and low soluble in accordance with the table below. Soils shall be
classified as low expansive in accordance with amended Table 1808.6.1.1.

Table 1804.4.1

Soil Condition Criteria Applicable Test Method
Low Coliapsible 0to< 3% ASTM D 2435
Low Soluble 0to<2% AWWA Standard Method 2540 (C)

Page 60 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



if, after the grading is completed, the anticipated total settlement (collapse,
consolidation, and/or compression) exceeds 1 inch, then the soil cannot be classified as
low collapsible.

Section 1804.6
Revise the Exception in Section 1804.6 to read as follows:

Exception: When a geotechnical investigation is not required by the building official the
in-place dry density within the building pad shall not be less than 90 percent of the
maximum dry density at near optimum moisture content determined in accordance with
ASTM D 1557.

Section 1805.2.1

Revise in Section 1805.2.1 to read as follows:

1805.2.1 Floors. Dampproofing materials for floors shall be installed between the floor
and the base course required by Section 1805.4.1, except where a separate floor is
provided above a concrete slab.

Where installed beneath the slab, dampproofing shall consist of not less than 10-mi
(.010 inch; 0.254 mm) poiyethylene conforming to ASTM E 1745 Class A requirements
with joints lapped not less than 6 inches (152 mm) or other approved methods or
materials. Where permitted to be installed on top of the slab, dampproofing shall consist
of mopped-on bitumen, not less than 4-mil (.004 inch; 0.012 mm) polyethylene, or other
approved methods or materials. Joints in the membrane shall be lapped and sealed in
accordance with the manufacturer's installation instructions.

Section 1807.2.3

Revise in Section 1807.2.3 o read as follows:

1807.2.3 Safety factor. Retaining walls shall be designed to resist the lateral action of
soil to produce sliding and overturning with a minimum safety factor of 1.5 in each case.
The load combinations of Section 1605 shall not apply to this requirement. Instead,
design shall be based on 0.7 times nominal earthquake loads, 0.6 nominal wind loads,
1.0 times other nominal loads, and investigation with one or more of the variable loads
set to zero. The safety factor against lateral sliding shall be taken as the available soil
resistance at the base of the retaining wall foundation divided by the net lateral force
applied to the retaining wall.

Exception: Where earthquake or wind loads are included, the minimum safety
factor for retaining wall sliding and overturning shafl be 1.1.

Section 1807.2.4

Revise in Section 1807.2.4 to read as follows:

Page 61 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



1807.2.4 Slope Stability Analysis. Retaining walls greater than ten feet in height shall
be required to submit a slope stability analysis performed by a registered design
professional. Multiple terraced (also sometimes referred to as stacked or tiered)
retaining walis with a total height of sixteen feet or more shall require a slope stability
analysis. Total height shall be measured from the bottom of the foundation to the top of
the retaining wall(s) or total slope height. The minimum factor of safety of 1.5 is required
for all failure modes under static loading conditions. The minimum factor of safety of 1.1
is required for all failure modes under seismic and wind loading conditions.

Section 1808.6.1.1

Add new Section 1808.6.1.1 to read as follows:

1808.6.1.1 Minimum Foundation Depth in Expansive Soils. The minimum foundation
depth requirements when placing foundations in expansive soil shall be per Table
1808.6.1.1.

Table 1808.6.1.1
Minimum Thickened Edge or Foundation Depth’

Expansion Percent Swell under 60 psf Minimum Thickened Edge or
Surcharge Foundation Depth
{inches)
Low >0to<4 12
Moderate >4t0<8 12°
High >8to <12 18
Critical 12 >12t0< 16 24
Critical 16 > 16t0 <20 30
Critical 20+ 20 or greater 36
Footnote:

1. Thickened edge embedment depth shall be measured from the top of the lowest
adjacent final compacted subgrade to the bottom of the footing.

2. 12" foundation depth shall be permitted for fully grouted retaining walls not to
exceed 6 feet (1.8288m) in height measured from the top of the footing for
residential subdivision walls.

Section 1808.6.2

Add new Section 1808.6.2 fo read as follows:

1808.6.2 Slab-On-Ground Foundations. Moments, shears, and deflections for use in
structural design of slab-on-ground, mat or raft foundations on expansive soils shall be
determined in accordance with WRI/CRSI Design of Slab-on-Ground Foundations or PT! DC
10.5.  Using the moments, shears and deflections determined above, nonprestressed
slabs-on-ground, mat or raft foundations on expansive soils shall be designed in accordance
with WRI/CRSI Design of Slab-on-Ground Foundations and post-tensioned slab-on-ground,
mat or raft foundations on expansive soils shall be in accordance with PTI DC 10.5. The
criteria for determining the expansive nature of soils are given in section 1803.5.3. The
minimum design criteria for post-tensioned slabs are defined in Table 1808.6.2. It shall be
permitted to analyze and design such slabs by other methods that account for soil-structure
interaction, the deformed shape of the soil support, the plate or stiffened plate action of the
slab as well as both center lift and edge lift conditions. Such alternate methods shall be

Page 62 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



rational and the basis for all aspects and parameters of the method shall be available for

peer review.
Table 1808.6.2 Post Tensioned Slab Criteria
Expansion Percent Swell under 60 psf | Design Values Ym (inches) for PT slabs

Surcharge Edge Lift Center Lift
Low >0to<4 1/8to 1/4 —
Moderate >4t0<8 1/4 t0 1/2 1/8 to 3/8
High >28to<12 V210 1 3/8to 1
Critical 12 >12t0<16 See Note No. 11
Critical 16 >16to <20 See Note No. 11
Critical 20+ 20 or greater See Note No. 11

Notes:

1. This chart is intended to address expansive soil. The presence of collapsible soil or
other geologic conditions may require different design criteria.

2. Foundations shall be designed to meet design criteria of PTI DC 10.5. Both edge lift
and center lift conditions need to be evaluated.

3. Edge moisture variation distance (Em) shall be a minimum of 2.5 feet for edge lift
and 4.75 feet for center lift.

4. CA for prefabricated roof truss clear spans shall be 360 for center lift and 800 for
edge lift.

5. Typical systems using stiffener beams may be equated to a flat slab of equivalent
stiffness. Stiffening beams in ribbed foundations shall be as required by PTI DC 10.5.
Conventionally reinforced designs may also be used.

6. Modulus of elasticity of the soil (Es) shall be taken as 1000 psi unless tests indicate
otherwise.

7. All concrete in the foundation system must be a minimum of 2500 psi and shall
comply with ACI 318-14 Table 19.3.2.1. Lean concrete shall not be permitted in slabs
or beams.

8. The calculated differential deflection of the foundation slab shall not exceed the
limitations of PTI DC 10.5 nor 1/2 inch for edge lift.

9. Perimeter loading of slab (P) shall be limited to dead load.

10. Expansion (swell) test shall be performed in accordance with Section 1803.5.3.

11. Specific recommendations from geotechnical engineer required. Design shear value
(Ym) shall be a minimum of 1 inch.

12. For soil conditions where a low swell potential is determined, a BRAB Type Il may be
used if specifically recommended by the geotechnical engineer.

Section 1808.8.7

Add new Section 1808.8.7 to read as follows:

1808.8.7 Use of non-structural slabs on ground to resist bearing loads. Where bearing
loads are proposed to be resisted by non-structural slabs on ground, all of the following
conditions shall be satisfied:

1. Structural calculations shall be provided to show the slab can adequately support the
proposed load.

Page 63 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



2. The maximum allowable subgrade bearing pressure below the slab shall be no
greater than 750 psf, with no increases allowed for short duration loads, unless a
greater value is justified in a geotechnical investigation report.

3. As an alternate to item 2, calculations utilizing a modulus of subgrade reaction of 20
pci can be assumed in the absence of a site specific geotechnical investigation and
can be used along with a factor of safety of 3.

Section 1808.10

Add new Section 1808.10 to read as follows:

1808.10 Minimum Distance to Ground Faulting. The minimum distances from an
occupied structure to ground faulting are as follows:

1. The minimum setback from a Holocene active fault shall be fifty {(50) feet.

2. The minimum setback from a Quaternary active fault shali be five (5) feet,

3. No setback shali be imposed when the geotechnical report establishes that no fault
or fauit zone exists on the project.

4. For single lot single family residences, the fault location may be approximated by the
geotechnical engineer through historical research. A setback of at least fifty (50) feet
from each side of the historically approximated fault edge shall be established.

If, through exploration, the fauit location is defined, historically approximated, or if the
geotechnical report imposes a no-build zone, then the fault and the minimum setback
shall be clearly shown to scale on the grading plan, plot plan, and final map; no portion
of the foundation system shall be constructed within that zone.

Section 1809.4

Revise Section 1809.4 to read as follows:

1809.4 Depth and width of footings. The minimum depth of footings below the
undisturbed ground surface shall be 12 inches (305 mm), unless a greater minimum
depth is required by the building official. Where applicabie, the requirements of Section
1809.5 shall aiso be satisfied. All excavations and the depth of any footing must be
made below the lowest adjacent compacted subgrade to facilitate full embedment of the
footing into the compacted subgrade prior to concrete placement. The minimumn width of
footings shalil be 12 inches (305 mm).

Section 1907.1

Revise Section 1907.1 to read as follows:

1907.1 General. The thickness of concrete floor slabs supported directly on the ground
shall not be less than 3-1/2 inches (89mm). A 10-mil (.010 inch; 0.254 mmj)_polyethylene
vapor retarder conforming to ASTM E 1745 Class A requirements with joints lapped not
less than 6 inches (152 mm) shall be placed between the base course or subgrade and
the concrete floor slab, or other approved equivalent methods shall be used to retard
vapor transmission through the floor slab.

Page 64 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



Exception: The vapor retarder is not required:

1. For detached structures accessory to occupancies in Group R-3, such as
garages, utility buildings or other unheated facilities.

2. For unheated storage rooms having an area of iess than 70 square feet (6.5m?)
and carports attached to occupancies in Group R-3.

3. For buildings of other occupancies where migration of moisture through the slab
from below will not be detrimentai to the intended occupancy of the building.

4. From driveways, walks, patios and other flatwork which will not be enclosed at a
later date.

5. Where approved based on local site conditions.

Section 2304.10

Revise Section 2304.10 to read as follows:

2304.10 Connectors and fasteners. Connectors and fasteners shall comply with the
applicabie provisions of sections 2304.10.1 through 2304.10.8.

Section 2304.10.8

Add new Section 2304.10.8 to read as follows:

2304.10.8 Bottom (sill) plate anchorage. Where field conditions preclude the
placement of the minimum bottom plate anchors, a registered design professional may
provide a design for the attachment in accordance with accepted engineering practice.

Section 2308.5.8

Revise Section 2308.5.80 to read as follows:

2308.5.8 Pipes in walls. Stud partitions containing plumbing, heating or other pipes
shail be so framed and the joists underneath so spaced as to give proper clearance for
the piping. Where a partition containing such piping runs parallei to the floor joists, the
joists underneath such partitions shall be doubled and spaced to permit the passage of
such pipes and shail be bridged. Where plumbing, heating or other pipes are placed in
or partly in a partition, necessitating the cutting of the soles or plates, a metal tie not less
than 0.058 inch (1.47mm) (16 galvanized gage) and 1 ¥ inches (38mm) wide shall be
fastened to each plate across and to each side of the opening with not less than six 1 %"
X 0.148” minimum nails.

Section 2606.7.4

Revise Section 2606.7.4 to read as follows:
2606.7.4 Fire suppression system. In buildings that are equipped throughout with an

automatic sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1, plastic light-diffusing
systems shall be protected both above and below unless the sprinkler system has been

Page 65 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



specifically approved for installation only above the light-diffusing system. Areas of light-
diffusing systems that are protected in accordance with this section shall be limited_to a
maximum panel area of 100 square feet with a maximum dimension of 15 feet. Adjacent
panels shall be separated by at least 8 feet vertical and 4 feet horizontal.

Section 2606.7.5
Revise Section 2606.7.5 to read as follows:

2606.7.5 Electrical luminaires. Light-transmitting plastic panels and light-diffuser
panels that are installed in approved electrical luminaires shall comply with the
requirements of Chapter 8 unless the light-transmitting plastic panels conform to the
requirements of Section 2606.7.2. The area of approved light-transmitting plastic
materials that are used in required exits or corridors shall not exceed the limitations
listed in Sections 2606.7.3 and 2606.7.4 as applicable.

Section 2607

Revise Section 2607 to read as follows:

2607.3 Height limitation. Light-transmitting plastics shall not be installed more than 75
feet (22 860 mm) above grade plane, except as allowed by Section 2607.5.

2607.4 Area limitation and separation. The maximum area of a single wall panel and
minimum vertical and horizontal separation requirements for exterior light-transmitting
plastic wall panels shall be as provided for in Table 2607.4, The maximum percentage of
wall area of any story in light-transmitting plastic wall panels shall not exceed that
indicated in Table 2607.4 or the percentage of unprotected openings permitted by
Section 705.8, whichever is smaller.

Exceptions:

1. Veneers of approved weather-resistant light-transmitting plastics used as exterior
siding in buildings of Type V construction in compliance with Section 1405.

2. The area of light-transmitting plastic wall paneis in exterior walls of greenhouses shali
be exempt from the area limitations of Table 2607.4 but shall be limited as required for
unprotected openings in accordance with Section 705.8.

2607.5 Automatic sprinkler system. Where the building is equipped throughout with an
automatic sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1, the maximum
percentage area of exterior wall in any story in light-transmitting plastic wall panels and
the maximum square footage of a single area given in Table 2607.4 shall be increased
100 percent, but the area of light-transmitting plastic wall panels shall not exceed 50
percent of the wall area in any story, or the area permitted by Section 705.8 for
unprotected openings, whichever is smaliler.

Section 2608.2

Revise Section 260.2 to read as follows:

Page 66 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



2608.2 Buildings of other types of construction. Openings in the exterior walls of
buildings of types of construction other than Type VB, where not required to be protected
by Section 705, shall be permitted to be glazed or equipped with light-transmitting plastic
in accordance with Section 2606 and all of the following:

Item 1 to remain unchanged

3. Light-transmitting plastics shall not be installed more than 75 feet (22 860 mm)
above grade level.

Section 2611

Revise 2611 to read as follows:

2611.1 General. Light-transmitting plastic interior signs shall be limited as specified in
Sections 2606 and 2611.2 through 2611.4. LED panel displays shall comply with
Section 2611.5.

Exception: Light transmitting plastic interior wall signs in covered and open mall
buildings shall comply with Section 402.6.4.

2611.2 Maximum area. The aggregate area of all light-transmitting plastics in each
individual sign shall not exceed 24 square feet (2.23 m2).

Exceptions:

1. Signs are permitted to exceed an aggregate area of 24 square feet of light
transmitting plastics, provided the light-transmitting plastic meets all the
following:

a. does not exceed 100 square feet,

b. is a minimum CC1 material,

¢. isinstalled in a building fully protected by automatic sprinklers in
accordance with Section 903.3.1.1, and

d. isinstalled in a sign that is listed and labeled in accordance with
nationally recognized standards.

2. Signs exceeding the 100 square foot limitation of Exception 1 are permitted
provided the sign meets all the following:

the height does not exceed 10 feet,

the length does not exceed 60 feet,

the area does not exceed 500 square feet,

the light-transmitting plastic is a minimum CC1 material,

is listed and labeied in accordance with nationaily recognized standards,

the space in which the sign is installed is protected with an automatic

sprinkier system of at least Ordinary Hazard Group 2, and

a Fire Protection Report is provided to substantiate the preceding

requirements are met.

NN

©

2611.3 Separation. Signs shall be separated from each other by not less than 4 feet
(1219mm) horizontally and 8 feet (2438 mm) vertically.

2611.4 Encasement. Backs of wall-mounted signs and non-illuminated portions of all
signs regulated by this section shall be fully encased in metal.

2611.5 LED Display Panels. Signs or displays utilizing LED display panels shall comply
with this section of the code.

Page 67 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



Panels used for LED displays shall be /isted appliances.

Panel displays under 100 square feet in aggregate area shall not require any

additional protection.

Panel displays between 100 square feet and 500 square feet in aggregate area

shall be located in a space protected by an automatic sprinkler system.

Pane! displays exceeding 500 square feet and below 1,000 square feet in

aggregate area shall be protected with a water curtain complying with NFPA 13

across the exposed face of the dispiay or be located in a space protected with an

automatic sprinkler system of at least Ordinary Hazard Group 2.

5. Panel displays of 1,000 or greater square feet in aggregate area shall be
protected by a water curtain complying with NFPA 13 across the exposed face of
the display.

6. For panel displays exceeding 500 square feet, a Fire Protection Report shall be

provided to substantiate the preceding requirements are met.

AW e

Section 2613

Delete exceptions 1 and 2 of Section 2613.5 and revise Section 2613 to read as follows:

2613.1 General. The provisions of this section shall govern the requirements and uses
of fiber-reinforced polymer in and on buildings and structures.

2613.2 Labeling and identification. Packages and containers of fiber-reinforced
polymer and their components delivered to the job site shall bear the /abel of an
approved agency showing the manufacturer's name, product listing, product
identification and information sufficient to determine that the end use will comply with the
code requirements.

2613.3 Interior finishes. Fiber-reinforced polymer used as interior finishes, decorative
materials or trim shall comply with Chapter 8.

2613.3.1 Foam plastic cores. Fiber-reinforced polymer used as interior finish and that
contain foam plastic cores shall comply with Chapter 8 and Chapter 26.

2613.4 Light-transmitting materials. Fiber-reinforced polymer used as light-
transmitting materials shall comply with Sections 2606 through 2611 as required for the
specific application.

2613.5 Exterior use. Fiber-reinforced polymer shall be permitted to be installed on the
exterior walls of buildings of any type of construction when such polymers meet the

requirements of Section 2603.5. Fireblocking shall be installed in accordance with
Section 718.

Section 2902.2

Table 2902.1

Amend Table 2902.1 to read as follows:

Page 68 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018



WATER CLOSETS BATHTUBS/ DRINKING

No. | CLASSIFICATION | DESCRIPTION (URINALS" LAVATORIES | ‘sHowERS | FOUNTAINS* | OTHER®
MALE FEMALE MALE | FEMALE
1 per 100 1 per 50 for
for the first | the first 400 1 per 250 for the first
400 and and 750 and
1| Assembly o™ | e’ | fes® | 4 porsonforthe : - oty
remainder remainder remalnde;szxcaedmg
exceeding exceeding
400 400
Buildings for the
transaction of
business,
professional
2 Business ser:'::’isé:sther 11 peerrz.‘s%fgrttt:\z?esrt‘l:ﬁ'lggg Lop:-':q‘fgratrheeoﬁg: - 1 per 100 1service
involving P axcesding 50 the remainder pe sink®
merchandise, 9 exceading 80
office buildings,
banks, light
industrial and
similar uses.
Adult day care 1per15 1per15 1 1 per 1,000 1 sseirr‘vkice
5 Institutional
Child day care 1per 15 1per 15 - 1per1000 | ! Service
Retail stores,
service stations,
shops, .
8 | Mercantile salesrooms, 1 per 500 1 per 750 - 1 per 1,000 1 ssje,::l'ae
markets and
shopping
centers
a. The fixtures are based on one fixture being the minimum required for the number of persons indicated or any fraction of the
number of persons indicated. The number of occupants shall be determined by this code.
b. Toilet facilities for employees shall be separate from facilities for inmates or care patients.
¢. A single-occupant toilet room with one water closet and one lavatory serving not more than two adjacent patient sleaping units
shall be permitted, provided that each patient sleeping unit has direct access to the toilet room and provisions for privacy for
the toilet room user are provided.
d. The occupant load for seasonal outdoor seating and entertainment areas shall be included when determining the minimum
number of facilities required.
€.  Drinking fountains and service sinks are not required for an occupant load of 50 or fewer,
f. The required number and type of plumbing fixtures for outdoor swimming pools shall be in accordance with Section 609 of the
International Swimming Pool and Spa Code.
g. Where restaurants provide drinking water in a container free of charge, drinking fountains shall not be required in those
restaurarts. In other occupancies where drinking fountains are required, water dispensers that provide water t¢ occupants free
of charge shall be pemmitted to be substituted for not more than 50 percent of the required number of dri nking fountains.
h. In each bathroom or toilet room, urinals shall not be substituted for more than 67 percent of the required water closets in

assembly and educational occupancies. Urinals shall not be substituted for more than 50 percent of the required water closets
in all other cccupancies.

Amend Section 2902.2 to read as follows:

[P] 2902.2 Separate Facilitles. Where plumbing fixtures are required, separate
facilities shall be provided for each sex.

Exceptions:
1. Separate facilities shall not be required for dwelling units and sleeping units.

Page 69 of 92 Dated: July 3, 2018




2. Separate facilities shall not be required in structures or tenant spaces with a total
occupant load, including both employees and customers, of 30 or fewer.

3. Separate facilities shall not be required in Group M occupancies in which the
maximum occupant load is 100 or fewer.

4. Separate facilities shall not be required in Group B occupancies in which the
maximum occupant load is 50 or fewer provided a single toilet facility is designed
for use by no more than one person at a time.

Section 3002.4
Amend Section 3002.4 to read as follows:

3002.4 Elevator car to accommodate ambulance stretcher. Where elevators are
provided in buildings four or more stories above, or four or more sfories below, grade
plane, not fewer than one elevator, and no less than the minimum number specified in
the exception to Section 403.6.1 when provided in lieu of fire service access elevators,
shall be provided for fire department emergency access to all floors. The elevator car
shall be of such a size and arrangement to accommodate an ambulance stretch 24
inches by 84 inches (601 mm by 2134 mm) with not less than 5-inch (127 mm) radius
corners, in the horizontal, open position and shail be identified by the international
symbol for emergency medical services (star of life). The symbol shall not be less than 3
inches (76 mm} in height and shall be placed inside on both sides of the hoistway door
frame. Such elevators shall open intc a lobby providing sufficient area to accommodate
transport of a 24-inch by 84-inch (610 mm by 2134 mm) ambulance stretcher.

Section 3006.2
Amend Section 3006.2 #5 to read
3006.2 Hoistway opening protection required.

5. The building is a high-rise and the elevator hoistway is more than 55 feet (17 m) in
height. The height of the hoistway shall be measur